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Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
I can confirm that the information requested is held by Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board. I have attached the information that is being released to you.  

Your Request: 
BSL/SSE

a. How many requests have been made to the Health Board for BSL/SSE to English interpreters?

b. How many of these requests were confirmed/fulfilled?

c. How many were fulfilled by staff and how many by agency staff?

d. What were the main reasons for an interpreter being unavailable to attend any unfulfilled requests?


Deaf Blind

a. How many requests have been made to the Health Board for deaf blind interpreters?

b. How many of these requests were confirmed/fulfilled?

c. How many were fulfilled by staff and how many by agency staff?

d. What were the main reasons for an interpreter being unavailable to attend any unfulfilled requests?

 

Please provide a breakdown of the above for the years 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023 and Jan - May 2024.It would be appreciated if the information could, where appropriate, be provided in table form and the response shared with myself and those cc'd.
Our Response:
The information you have requested is not held by the Health Board. We can confirm however that the information requested is held by the Welsh Interpretation and Translation Service (WITS) at Cardiff Council with whom we have a contract.  They support BCUHB through the provision of Interpreters when needed for patient/staff interaction.  We have however been able to respond to the last two questions and are attached in the table, as requested below.
Under Section 16 of the Freedom of Information Act, the Health Board has the duty to provide help and assistance; therefore, if you wish to contact WITS for this information, I have provided their contact details below:

Wales Interpretation and Translation Service (WITS)
Room 439, County Hall, Atlantic Wharf, Cardiff, CF10 4UW

E-bost/Email: WITS@caerdydd.gov.uk / WITS@cardiff.gov.uk 

Ffôn/Tel: 02920 537555

	BSL/SSE
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024  (Jan-May)

	How many requests have been made to the Health Board for BSL/SSE to English interpreters?
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held

	How many of these requests were confirmed/fulfilled?
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held

	How many were fulfilled by staff and how many by agency staff?
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held

	What were the main reasons for an interpreter being unavailable to attend any unfulfilled requests?

Information not held


	Deaf Blind
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024  (Jan-May)

	How many requests have been made to the Health Board for deaf blind interpreters?
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held

	How many of these requests were confirmed/fulfilled?
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held

	How many were fulfilled by staff and how many by agency staff?
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held
	Information Not Held

	What were the main reasons for an interpreter being unavailable to attend any unfulfilled requests?


Information not held


	Does the Health Board employ any BSL/SSE/deaf blind interpreters within the Health Board, on a full-time staff basis?

	No BSL/SSE/deaf blind interpreters are employed within the Health Board on a full-time staff basis.

	Does the Health Board have a contract with a video relay service?
	Yes, contract is held with WITS (Welsh Interpretation and Translation Service) details provided.


  
  

