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Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
I am pleased to provide some of the information you have requested. I have enclosed copies of the information. 
 
Your request and our response:
Please provide the following figures relating to the Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) Primary Care Clinical Governance Department.

Please summarise by year, going back as far as is practicable and including 2024 to-date.
Please note that the data that follows has been extracted from two different Datix systems. Therefore, the fields and terminology used may not be exactly replicated.  The Legacy Datix system was operational until 2022 with the new Datix RL system being implemented in 2022, with some cross over during the transitional period. 

The data includes complaints received for General Practice, Community Pharmacy, Dental Practices and Opticians.

1. The number of complaints received.
6,291 complaints have been received into the Primary Care Clinical Governance department since 2011 to date. 
This includes the number of formal complaints and On the Spots/Early Resolutions. Please note, that for some of these cases, consent may not have been received or a complaint may have been withdrawn and as such, not all of these complaints will have been responded to. 

This total does not include any enquiries (such as AM/MP enquiries or PALS enquiries).  
Please refer to the attached spreadsheet to see a breakdown per year.
2. The number of complaints referred back to the complainee for investigation and how many of those were upheld.

In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.
The Health Board does not hold the data in a format that would enable us to respond to your request to the level of detail required. As this is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to collate this data by conducting a manual search of each individual complaint record. From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff approximately 524 hours to locate and review each record of the 6,291 complaints received. This figure is based on a timescale of 5 minutes per complaint record. Therefore, obtaining the data would work out at approximately 524 hours x £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £13,100.
As you will be aware this is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.
3. The number of complaints investigated by the NHS and how many of those were upheld.

Please refer to response to Question 2 above. 

4. The number of complaints subsequently taken to the ombudsman or other party and how many of those were upheld.

Please refer to response to Question 2 above. 

5. If the complainant is classified by a demographic/type/age etc. then I'd like to see that breakdown in the data.

This data is not recorded by BCUHB. 

6. If the complainee is classified by type eg GP/Optician/Pharmacist etc. then I'd like to see that breakdown in the data.

Please refer to the attached spreadsheet.

7. If the nature of the complaint is classified by a type then I'd like to see that breakdown in the data.

Please refer to the attached spreadsheet. 

 
  
  

