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	Our ref: 1882654
7th of May 2024
 
‎ 
	 


Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
I can confirm that the information requested is held by Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board. I have enclosed copies of the information that is being released to you.  
 

Your Request and Our Response:

I wish to make an application for information relating to referrals made to the neurodiverse service for assessment, diagnosis, treatment and support for autism and ADHD.

Please provide information for both children and adult services.
 
1. Years 2014 - 2019 (5-year period)
a) How many referrals were received into the service each month and each year?
Adults: 

Regrettably, Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) do not hold the information as requested due to how it has been previously recorded/captured but we are able to provide information from 01/04/2019 – 31/03/2024 (shown below)

Children:
Regrettably, BCUHB do not hold the information as requested due to how it has been previously recorded/captured but we are able to provide information from April 2017 onwards. 
	
	2017-18
	2018-19

	April
	143
	183

	May
	180
	204

	June
	172
	206

	July
	224
	184

	August
	221
	150

	September
	160
	137

	October
	173
	204

	November
	169
	179

	December
	145
	165

	January
	106
	196

	February
	124
	219

	March
	154
	178

	12-Month Position
	1971
	2205


b) How many children received a diagnosis of autism and or ADHD and or other diagnoses within each month and year?
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Health Board can confirm that the details you requested are logged within the patient’s file only (in excess of 4176 files), and we have established that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff approximately 334.08 hours to locate and review the records across 3 acute hospital sites. This figure is based on a timescale of 5 minutes per record, there being over nine thousand records to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 334.08 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £8352.  As you will be aware this is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.
2. Years 2019 - 2024 (5-year period)
a) How many referrals were received into the service each month and each year
Adults: 
	
	2019-20
	2020-21
	2021-22
	2022-23
	2023-24

	April
	3002
	1554
	3031
	2786
	3068

	May
	3010
	1907
	3088
	3279
	3442

	June
	2979
	2901
	3287
	3143
	3531

	July
	3131
	3047
	3354
	3063
	3448

	August
	2736
	2558
	2991
	3219
	3698

	September
	2981
	3032
	3345
	3309
	3516

	October
	3399
	3066
	3025
	3333
	3731

	November
	2982
	2986
	3467
	3377
	3486

	December
	2702
	2688
	2943
	2540
	2982

	January
	3312
	2723
	2960
	3322
	3490

	February
	3143
	2726
	3035
	3283
	3305

	March
	2471
	3433
	3263
	3665
	3282



Children:

	
	2019-20
	2020-21
	2021-22
	2022-23
	2023-24

	April
	251
	121
	156
	261
	320

	May
	202
	100
	260
	297
	513

	June
	199
	117
	280
	266
	517

	July
	274
	110
	293
	418
	556

	August
	148
	124
	133
	188
	229

	September
	108
	117
	192
	321
	329

	October
	207
	194
	227
	387
	406

	November
	184
	218
	227
	349
	400

	December
	212
	167
	291
	357
	388

	January
	212
	149
	245
	327
	340

	February
	222
	184
	270
	461
	376

	March
	222
	241
	317
	477
	437

	12-month position
	2441
	1842
	2891
	4109
	4811


b) How many children received a diagnosis of autism and or ADHD and or other diagnoses within each month and year
Adults: 

This Freedom of Information request asks about referrals made to made to the neurodiverse service for assessment, diagnosis, treatment and support for autism and ADHD. The Neurodiverse service doesn’t provide autism assessments, these are provided by the North Wales Integrated Autism Service. We do provide assessments and treatment for ADHD but this is done as part of the overall work of the community mental health teams and is not monitored or recorded separately. Therefore, this would require a manual trawl through 185,556 records which exceeds the appropriate cost limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Health Board can confirm that the details you requested are logged within the patient’s file only (a total of 185,556 referrals), and we have established that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff approximately 14,844.48 hours to locate and review the records across 3 acute hospital sites. This figure is based on a timescale of 5 minutes per record, there being over nine thousand records to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 14,844.48 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £371,112.  As you will be aware this is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.

Children:
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Health Board can confirm that the details you requested are logged within the patient’s file only (in excess of 15,657 files), and we have established that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff approximately 1252.56 hours to locate and review the records across 3 acute hospital sites. This figure is based on a timescale of 5 minutes per record, there being over nine thousand records to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 1252.56 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £31,314.  As you will be aware this is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.
  
  

