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‎
	 


Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
I can confirm that the information requested is held by Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board. I have enclosed copies of the information that is being released to you.  

Your request:

Could you please provide answers to the following five questions related to the incidence and treatment of Haemophilia B and Von Willebrand Disease?
 
Q1. How many patients has your Trust treated (for any medical condition) in the past 3 months with the following drugs:
       
Alphanate    
Alprolix        
BeneFIX      
HaemateP     
Idelvio       
Refixia      
Rixubis        
Veyvondi       
Voncento     
Wilate       
Willfact
 
Q2.  How many patients have been treated in the past 3 months with:
      
a. Gene therapy for Haemophilia B ONLY  
b. Desmopressin for Von Willebrand Disease ONLY     
c. Tranexamic Acid for Von Willebrand Disease ONLY
 

Q3.  Of the patients that were treated with Veyvondi in the past 3 months, how many patients received treatment:
 
a. During surgery  
b. On demand to treat bleeding episodes


 
Q4.  Of the patients that were treated with Voncento in the past 3 months, how many patients received treatment:
      
a. During surgery    
b. On demand to treat bleeding episodes


 
Q5.  How many patients are registered with your trust for the following diseases:
   
a. Haemophilia B     
b. Von Willebrand Disease    
c. Von Willebrand Disease - paediatric patients (age 17 or under)
Our Response:
We have provided the data using <5 ‘less than 5’ due to the low numbers involved and the very short time window of the request criteria ie 3 months.  If we were to release the exact figures for the criteria specified, they could be linked with other information available in the public domain, thus potentially risking identification of individuals.

	Q1. How many patients has your Health Board treated (for any medical condition) in the past 3 months with the following drugs:

	Alphanate
	Nil

	Alprolix
	Nil

	BeneFIX
	Nil

	HaemateP
	Nil

	Idelvion
	Nil

	Refixia
	Nil

	Rixubis
	Nil

	Veyvondi
	<5

	Voncento
	<5

	Wilate
	Nil

	Willfact
	Nil


	Q2.  How many patients have been treated in the past 3 months with:

	Gene therapy for Haemophilia B ONLY
	Nil

	Desmopressin for Von Willebrand Disease ONLY
	Not recorded

	Tranexamic Acid for Von Willebrand Disease ONLY
	Not recorded


	Q3.  Of the patients that were treated with Veyvondi in the past 3 months, how many patients received treatment:

	During surgery
	Nil

	On demand to treat bleeding episodes
	<5


	Q4.  Of the patients that were treated with Voncento in the past 3 months, how many patients received treatment:

	During surgery
	Nil

	On demand to treat bleeding episodes
	<5


	Q5.  How many patients are registered with your Health Board for the following diseases:

	Haemophilia B
	Nil

	Von Willebrand Disease
	5

	Von Willebrand Disease - paediatric patients (age 17 or under)
	Nil


  
  

