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Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
I can confirm that the information requested is held by Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board. 
Your request and our response:

1. Please provide the number of Accident & Emergency waiting time breaches over the last 12 months. 
Please refer to the table below which includes the number of 4 hour breaches in A&E Departments across Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) from 1st November 2022 – 31st October 2023. 
	Month
	Nov 2022
	Dec 2022
	Jan 2023
	Feb 2023
	Mar 2023
	Apr 2023
	May 2023
	Jun 2023
	Jul 2023
	Aug 2023
	Sep 2023
	Oct 2023
	Total

	Total number of breaches
	6211
	7137
	4861
	4423
	6024
	6204
	6550
	6248
	6546
	6487
	6008
	6603
	73,302


2. Please provide the number of discharges resulting in re-attendance via A&E over the last 12 months. Please include the names of the wards these discharges came from. 
There were 7881 emergency readmissions to BCUHB within 28 days of discharge via Emergency Departments (ED) from November 2022 to October 2023.
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.
The Health Board does not hold the data in a format that would enable us to respond to your request to the level of detail required. As this is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to collate this data.  From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff approximately 657 hours to locate and review the notes of the 7881 emergency readmissions referred to above, in order to establish which ward they were discharged from. This figure is based on a timescale of 5 minutes per set of patient notes. Therefore, obtaining the data would work out at approximately 657 hours x £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £16,425.
As you will be aware this is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.
3. Please provide evidence that Bromfield Ward had no available beds on 02.11.2023 at 7.16 pm.
We do not hold this information. However, under the Health Board’s obligation to advise and assist, the October 2023 bed report states that Bromfield Ward has 9 funded beds. At 12:00 am on 02.11.2023 there were 10 beds occupied.
 
  
  

