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Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
I can confirm that the information requested is held by Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board. I have detailed below the information that is being released to you.  

Your request and our response:

1. Do(es) your hospital(s) have a solution to eliminate pathogens from the air?

 Yes. 
1.1  In which departments?

 Clinical areas including inpatient wards. 
1.2  In which rooms?

 Most rooms withing the above areas. 
1.3  What technology(ies) are in use?

Air circulation with Ultra Violet (UV) 
Yes.
Air Circulation with Air Filter

No. 
Air Circulation with Air Filter and UV

No. 
HVAC with UV

No. 
HVAC without UV

No. 
1.4  Other (Which technology?)

 Hypochlorus acid misting / fogging.
2. Do(es) your hospital(s) have a solution to eliminate pathogens from the surfaces?

 Yes. 
2.1  In which departments?

All clinical areas.
2.2  In which rooms?

All rooms within clinical areas. 
2.3  What technology(ies) are in use to kill pathogens?:

UV

Yes. 
What wavelenght?

254nm.
In which areas of the hospital?

Most clinical areas.
Antimicrobial coating

No.
Which coating materials?

Not Applicable. 
In which areas of the hospital?

Not Applicable. 
Antimicrobial cleaning products

Yes. 
Which chemicals?

Chlorine releasing agents and Disinfectant wipes are the most common. There are a number of more specialised products used in specialist decontamination areas.
In which areas of the hospital?

All clinical areas. 
Antimicrobial materials

Yes. 
Which materials

Curtains.
In which areas of the hospital?

Some clinical areas.
HVAC with UV

No. 
HVAC without UV

No.
2.4 Other (Which technology?)

None. 
3. What are the three most important areas to have a solution to kill pathogens from the air?

This information is not recorded BCUHB data.

4. What are the three most important areas to have a solution to kill pathogens from the surfaces?

This information is not recorded BCUHB data.

5. Which department(s) / professional(s) make(s) the procurement decisions regarding solutions to kill pathogens from the air?
Infection Prevention team. 
  
  

