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Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
I can confirm that the information requested is held by Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board. I have detailed below the information that is being released to you.  

Your request and our response:

I am requesting the following information on local healthcare and support service provision for multiple myeloma (MM) patients. Please provide the following information:

As of 1 Jan 2024:

1. Total population size served by Health Board.
This information is not recorded by the Health Board. 
Under our obligation to advise and assist, this information may be available on Stats Wales. Please see link to website below. 

Catalogue (gov.wales)
2. Number of hospitals providing oncology services
3 acute hospitals.
3. Total number of consultant haematologists employees; specialist haematology registrars employed; consultant haematologists specialising in multiple myeloma; haematology clinical nurse specialists employed and multiple myeloma clinical nurse specialists.
	Position Title
	Headcount

	GP with Specialist Interest
	1

	Consultant
	2

	Consultant
	2

	Locum Fixed Term Consultant
	5

	Specialty Doctor (2008 contract)
	2

	Specialty Doctor (2021 contract)
	2

	Clinical Nurse Specialist
	8


Please note that we do not hold detailed information with regard to the specialisms within Haematology, such as 'multiple myeloma'. For Medical & Dental employees 'Haematology' has been selected from the Area of Work Field in ESR and the Occupation Codes selected are also applicable to Haematology only. Within Cancer Services there are other Medical and Dental employees and these are recorded under Medical or Clinical Oncology - These have not been included within the figures above. For Medical and Dental employees all roles have been included. In terms of Nursing and Midwifery employees, only Clinical Nurse Specialists have been included.

During 2023 (1 Jan - 31 Dec), please provide the:

4. Total number of multiple myeloma (MM) cases diagnosed (Please state which code(s) were used)
Due to the way information is recorded, we are unable to state when a patient was diagnosed with MM, we can only provide when they were discharged with a diagnosis code of *C900* - Multiple myeloma. Coding is only complete to Welsh Government standard to the end of July 2023. 
	2023-01
	2023-02
	2023-03
	2023-04
	2023-05
	2023-06
	2023-07
	Grand Total

	58
	21
	14
	15
	13
	14
	8
	143


5. If known, how many people were diagnosed with smouldering multiple myeloma?
This information is no longer recorded due to changes in the ICD-10 regulations. 
6. How many in-person haematology-based consultation/telephone haematology-based consultations/ video haematology-based consultation took place for people diagnosed with MM?
Due to the way this information is recorded, it is not possible to differentiate between haematology appointments and appointments for those diagnosed with MM.
During 2023 (1 Jan - 31 Dec):

7. Were multiple myeloma (MM) patients discussed/reviewed at a MM specific Multidisciplinary team (MDT) or general haematology MDT?
General haematology MDT.
8. How frequently did MDT meetings meet?
Weekly. 
9. What percentage of MM patients diagnosed in 2023 were reviewed/discussed at a MDT?

100%.
10. Which professionals/disciplines are represented on MDT meetings for MM?
Haematologists, radiologists, oncologists and Clinical Nurse Specialists (CNS).
11. What supportive and palliative care services are available for MM patients?
CNS support, onward referral as required to specialist support services.
 
  
  

