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Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
I can confirm that the information requested is held by Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board. I have enclosed copies of the information that is being released to you.  

Your Request and Our Response:

1. Could you please tell me how many patients were treated in the last 3 months for Hidradenitis Suppurativa (HS) with the following biologic drugs:

	Biologic drug
	Number of patients treated in the last 3 months for Hidradenitis Suppurativa (HS)

	Adalimumab - Humira
	≤5

	Adalimumab Biosimilar
	9

	Bimekizumab
	0

	Certolizumab
	0

	Infliximab
	≤5

	Secukinumab
	0

	Ustekinumab
	0


Please Note: We have provided the data using ‘less than or equal to 5’ due to the low numbers involved.  If we were to release the exact figures for the criteria specified, they could be linked with other information available in the public domain, thus potentially risking identification of individuals.

2. In the past 3 months, how many patients with a primary diagnosis of giant cell arteritis (ICD10 codes M31.5 or M31.6) were:
a) Admitted as an inpatient
The table below shows the number of admissions with the requested ICD-10 diagnosis codes in Primary position. Clinical coding is only verified up until June 2023, therefore we have provided the last 3 months of verified data.
	
	April 2023
	May
	June
	Grand Total

	Number of patients
	≤5
	≤5
	7
	14


Please Note: We have provided the data using ‘less than or equal to 5’ due to the low numbers involved.  If we were to release the exact figures for the criteria specified, they could be linked with other information available in the public domain, thus potentially risking identification of individuals.
b) Treated in A&E
Unfortunately, data for the Emergency Department is not recorded in such detail. In order to find this information, we would have to manually trawl through the records of each patient admitted to the Emergency Department across all of our hospitals within BCUHB. This would exceed the cost limit under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. It is unclear the exact amount of time this will take however it will indefinitely cost more than £450 (cost permitted under the Act) in administrative duties.
3. How many patients were treated by the rheumatology department in the past 3 months with the following:

	Treated for
	Number of patients

	Tocilizumab - for any disease
	95

	Tocilizumab for rheumatoid arthritis (RA) only
	76

	Tocilizumab for giant cell arteritis (GCA) only
	≤5


Please Note: We have provided the data using ‘less than or equal to 5’ due to the low numbers involved.  If we were to release the exact figures for the criteria specified, they could be linked with other information available in the public domain, thus potentially risking identification of individuals.
4. How many patients were treated by the ophthalmology department (for any disease) in the past 3 months with Tocilizumab?
There have been no patients treated with Tovilizumab in the Ophthalmology department in the last 3 months.
5. How many patients were treated in A&E in the past 3 months (for any disease) with Tocilizumab?
Unfortunately, data for the Emergency Department is not recorded in such detail. In order to find this information, we would have to manually trawl through the records of each patient admitted to the Emergency Department across all of our hospitals within BCUHB. This would exceed the cost limit under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. It is unclear the exact amount of time this will take however it will indefinitely cost more than £450 (cost permitted under the Act) in administrative duties.
However, under our obligation to advise and assist, the pharmaceutical leads have

provided information regarding the number of items supplied to the Emergency Department which may be of use. Please note, this does not necessarily mean the number of patients treated.

There were 25 items of tocilizumab supplied to the Emergency Department in the last 3 months (November 2023 - January 2024). This does not cover those booked out to individual consultants because we could not identify if the patient was in the Emergency Department or elsewhere in the hospital, or for those supplied via the emergency cupboard out of hours. The items supplied where either Tocilizumab 200mg in 10ml infusion, tocilizumab 400mg in 20ml infusion or 80mg in 4mL.
  
  

