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Freedom of Information Act 2000
 

Unfortunately, I am unable to comply with your request in full as Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board do not hold all of the information you have requested. However, I am pleased to provide the following in response to part of your request.

Your Request and Our Response:
 
i) the total number of in-House mental Health Patient deaths for his period 
The table below shows the total number of people who were an inpatient on a mental health unit or a learning disabilities ward at the time of their death. These numbers account for all deaths including those of natural causes. The numbers also include people who may have been on leave from the ward when they passed away. 
	Year
	Total

	2012/13
	4

	2013/14
	17

	2014/15
	7

	2015/16
	4

	2016/17
	5

	2017/18
	 11

	2018/19
	2

	2019/20
	10

	2020/21
	21

	2021/22
	6



ii) those deaths of patients detained under the mental Health act 
The table below shows the total number of people who were detained under the Mental Health Act at the time of their death. Please note, a person can be detained under the Mental Health Act in locations other than inpatient mental health units, for instance somebody could be detained under the Mental Health Act whilst the are an inpatient in a district general hospital.

The information for Question 1 was available from our electronic system. The information regarding the deaths of those who were detained under the Mental Health Act would have been held within the patients’ paper records prior to 2016 and this level of detail is not recorded on our electronic system. Regrettably, we do not hold the information for this question prior to 2016 because files are destroyed 8 years following the date of death and therefore all files for the period before 2016 have been destroyed.
	Year
	Total

	2012/13
	Not available

	2013/14
	Not available

	2014/15
	Not available

	2015/16
	Not available

	2016/17
	0

	2017/18
	1

	2018/19
	1

	2019/20
	3

	2020/21
	3

	2021/22
	4


 
iii) Those deaths of voluntary/informal patients
The table below shows the total number of people who passed away in an inpatient mental health unit and were not detained under the Mental Health Act at the time of their death.

The information for Question 1 was available from our electronic system. The information regarding the number of people who passed away in an inpatient mental health unit and who were not detained under the Mental Health Act at the time of their death would have been held within the patients’ paper records prior to 2016 and this level of detail is not recorded on our electronic system. Regrettably, we do not hold the information for this question prior to 2016 because files are destroyed 8 years following the date of death and therefore all files before 2016 have been destroyed.

	Year
	Total

	2012/13
	Not available

	2013/14
	Not available

	2014/15
	Not available

	2015/16
	Not available

	2016/17
	5

	2017/18
	11

	2018/19
	2

	2019/20
	10

	2020/21
	20

	2021/22
	5



Please note: Of those figures provided in question 1, one patient from 2020/21 and one patient from 2021/22 passed away in an inpatient mental health unit whilst detained under the Mental Health Act. (i.e., They’re included within the figures in Q2 and therefore isn’t included in Q3).
 
iv) deaths of any patients that were detained under DoLs 
The Health Board have established that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff approximately 23 hours to locate and manually trawl the records of deceased patients. This figure is based on a timescale of 15 minutes per case note, there being 92 case notes to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 23 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £575.  As you will be aware this is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.
 
  
  

