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Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
I can confirm that the information requested is held by Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board. I have detailed below the information that is being released to you.  
 

Your request and our response: 

Q1. How many patients have been treated in the past 3 months with the following agents for renal cell carcinoma (any stage):
We have provided the data using ‘equal or less than 5’ due to the low numbers involved.  If we were to release the exact figures for the criteria specified, they could be linked with other information available in the public domain, thus potentially risking identification of individuals.
	Treatment
	No. of Patients

	Avelumab + Axitinib
	7

	Axinitib
	0

	Cabozantinib
	0

	Everolimus
	0

	Lenvantinib + Everolimus
	0

	Nivolumab monotherapy
	8

	Nivolumab + Cabozantinib
	0

	Nivolumab + Ipilimumab
	≤5

	Pazopanib
	≤5

	Pembrolizumab monotherapy
	8

	Pembrolizumab + Lenvatinib
	10

	Pembrolizumab + Axitinib
	0

	Radiotherapy only
	Information not recorded.

	Sunitinib
	≤5

	Temsirolimus
	0

	Tivozanib
	7

	Other active systemic anti-cancer therapy
	0

	Palliative care only
	Information not recorded.


Q2. How many patients have been treated in the past 3 months with the following agents for melanoma (any stage) :

	Treatment
	No. of Patients

	Cobimetinib
	0

	Dabrafenib
	0

	Dabrafenib + Trametinib
	10

	Dacarbazine
	0

	Denosumab
	0

	Encorafenib + Binimetinib
	0

	Ipilimumab monotherapy
	≤5

	Ipilimumab + Nivolumab
	≤5

	Nivolumab monotherapy
	8

	Nivolumab + Relatlimab
	0

	Pembrolizumab 
	41

	Trametinib
	0

	Vemurafenib
	0

	Vemurafenib + Cobimetinib
	0

	Other active systemic anti-cancer therapy
	6

	Palliative care only
	Information not recorded.


Q3. Does you Health Board participate in any clinical trials for the treatment of melanoma? If so please provide the name of each trial and number of patients that are taking part?
The Health Board does not participate in any clinical trial for the treatment of melanoma currently.
  
  

