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Freedom of Information Act 2000

Your request and our response

1. How many GP surgeries in Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) provided ear wax removal services in 2023?
9 of the 12 GP Surgeries managed by BCUHB provided ear wax removal services in 2023. 

2. How many GP surgeries in BCUHB provided ear wax removal services in 2010?
In 2010 - the Health Board did not manage any GP Practices, so are therefore unable to answer this question. 
3. Please provide the number of patients referred to BCUHB hospital Ear, Nose & Throat (ENT) departments for ear wax removal?
ENT departments do get some referrals for ear wax removal. However, the Health Board does not hold the exact number as these referrals are not always coded. 
4. Please provide the number of patients attending BCUHB A&Es because of ear infections in 2023.

151 patients attended BCUHB A&E because of ear infections in 2023. 

5. Please provide the number of patients attending BCUHB A&Es because of ear infections in 2010.

The Health Board does not hold this information due to a change in Emergency Department systems. 
  
  

