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Freedom of Information Act 2000
Your request and our response:

Rimegepant for acute treatment of migraine (NICE TA919)
1. Given that patients in Cardiff & Vale UHB and Powys THB who are sat in front of their primary care GP, nurse or pharmacist suffering an acute migraine (provided they meet NICE criteria) can be prescribed Rimegepant by their primary care HCP, why has Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) decided that that should not be an option for patients in their Health Board?
Rimegepant is included on our BCUHB formulary with a purple formulary status. This was made available on 15th September 2023. 
A purple formulary status allows prescribers to prescribe such medicines whilst awaiting inclusion of the medicine into a treatment pathway. The purple formulary status makes the drug available to be prescribed by any healthcare professional following approval for use on an individual basis via a short purple application form which provides assurance that the individual patient meets the NICE criteria.
The neurology service in North Wales is a tertiary service and is provided by The Walton Centre NHS Foundation Trust.  We await Walton Centre DTC confirming the place of Rimegepant in the treatment pathway of acute migraine and where it is placed compared with other treatments that are already available to patients.

In accordance with the Health Board’s obligation to advise and assist we have included below the website link to the Freedom of Information section of the Walton Centre’s website.
Freedom of Information requests (thewaltoncentre.nhs.uk)
2. BCUHB is unique in Wales in deciding not to list Rimegepant for the treatment of acute migraine. How do you justify and intend to rectify this health inequality?

Rimegepant is included on our BCUHB formulary with a purple formulary status. Please refer to response to Question 1 above. 

3. What are the job titles of the people in BCUHB responsible for deciding that Rimegepant should not be available for acute migraine patients in BCUHB and in which departments do they work?
Not applicable (N/A). Nobody in BCUHB has decided that Rimegepant should not be made available to patients, it is listed on BCUHB formulary. 

4. What is the job title of the person responsible for outpatient waiting lists for Acute Migraine in BCUHB and what involvement did they have in the decision to not make Rimegepant accessible for BCUHB patients?

The neurology service in North Wales is a tertiary service and is provided by The Walton Centre NHS Foundation Trust.  

5. How many patients suffer from acute migraine in BCUHB?

We do not hold this information. The neurology service in North Wales is a tertiary service and is provided by The Walton Centre NHS Foundation Trust.  
6. How many patients in BCUHB meet the criteria for Rimegepant, and have exhausted all the options listed in section 04.07.04.02, i.e. Paracetamol, NSAIDs, Sumatriptan and Zolmitriptan?
We do not hold this information. The neurology service in North Wales is a tertiary service and is provided by The Walton Centre NHS Foundation Trust.  
7. For those patients identified in Question 5, when they are sat in front of their primary care HCP presenting with acute migraine, and all formulary options are exhausted, what is the BCUHB plan for them, given that they are sat in the primary care HCP and in pain?

A patient may access treatment from a clinician if they are knowledgeable about the treatment via the purple application form process as an interim until Walton Centre neurology colleagues agree its place in the pathway.

8. How many prescriptions for Rimegepant were written in BCUHB in 2023?

There have been 3 prescriptions for Rimegepant written in primary care – however, we are unable to establish if these are for the same individual patient.
9. For the last 12 month period for which you have data, please provide: 

· The number of patients who presented to A&E with migraine.

From 1st August 2022 – 31st July 2023, 470 patients presented to A&E with a diagnosis of migraine. 
· The number of patients who presented to Same Day Emergency Care (SDEC) with migraine.

Please refer to the table below which includes number of discharges from all SDEC wards with migraine in any diagnosis code position.

	Ward Name
	Total

	SDEC Ysbyty Gwynedd 
	101

	SDEC Ysbyty Glan Clwyd
	46

	SDEC Ysbyty Wrexham Maelor
	11

	Total
	158


· The number of patients who presented to out of hours with migraine.
From 1st November 2022 – 31st December 2023, 168 patients presented to out of hours with migraine. 
10. Will you please provide me with a copy of the minutes of the meeting at which it was decided not to list Rimegepant for acute migraine?

Rimepegant is listed on the formulary, hence no minutes exist to state that it is not listed.

We await Walton Centre DTC confirming the place of Rimegepant in the treatment pathway of acute migraine and where it is placed compared with other treatments already available to patients.
11. Do you consider primary care prescribers in BCUHB too stupid to prescribe a simple and straightforward migraine treatment, or is there some other reason you prevent them from prescribing medicine to patients in pain, when primary care prescribers in other health boards can? If so, what is this other reason? It can't be money, as NICE TA shows that the intervention is cost effective and must be made available. What is the real reason to keep your patients suffering the pain of migraine? Are you deliberately putting pressure on secondary care services in the hope that they will fail? Is this political?

We await Walton Centre DTC confirming the place of Rimegepant in the treatment pathway of acute migraine and where it is placed compared with other treatments already available to patients.
Daridorexant - for treating long-term insomnia (NICE TA922)
12.  More than two months has passed since TA922 was published, so why has Daridorexant not yet been made available?

Daridorexant is available on the BCUHB formulary for prescribing via the purple process.  This was made available on the formulary (with purple status) on 25th September 2023. 
A purple formulary status allows prescribers to prescribe such medicines whilst awaiting inclusion of the medicine into a treatment pathway. The purple formulary status makes the drug available to be prescribed by any healthcare professional following approval for use on an individual basis via a short purple application form which provides assurance that the individual patient meets the NICE criteria.

13. Will Daridorexant be made freely available for initiation in primary care for those patients who meet NICE criteria?

Daridorexant is already available for prescribing. We await clinicians determining its place in the treatment pathway in BCUHB. 

14. How many prescriptions for Daridorexant were written in Betsi Cadwaladr UHB in 2023?

<10 patients have had treatment with Daridorexant as per NICE TA.

15.  Will you please provide me with a copy of the minutes of the meeting at which it was decided to delay making Daridorexant available for patients by listing it as P = Purple (Pending Pathway)?

N/A. It has not been delayed in being made available, it is listed on the formulary.

16. Do you consider primary care prescribers in BCUHB too stupid to prescribe a simple and straightforward insomnia treatment without a pathway, or is there some other reason you prevent them from prescribing medicine to patients in need, when primary care prescribers in other health boards can? If so, what is this other reason? It can't be money, as NICE TA shows that the intervention is cost effective and must be made available. What is the real reason to keep your patients at increased risk of hypertension, diabetes, obesity, depression, heart attack and stroke? Are you deliberately putting pressure on secondary care services in the hope that they will fail? Is this political?

Any healthcare professional can currently access and prescribe this treatment for individual patients as per the NICE TA. Once a formal Drugs and therapeutics application is submitted, with inclusion into a pathway, the formulary status would be reviewed.

Tirzepatide for treating type 2 diabetes (NICE TA924)
17.  More than two months has passed since TA924 was published, so why has Tirzepatide not yet been made available?

Tirzepatide is available on the BCUHB formulary. This was made available on the formulary on 15th September 2023. 
18.  How many prescriptions for Tirzepatide were written in BCUHB in 2023?

No expressions of interest has been received for a patient to be treated with Tirzepatide to date. 

19.  Will you please provide me with a copy of the minutes of the meeting at which it was decided to delay making Tirzepatide available for patients by listing it as P = Purple (Pending Pathway)?

N/A. Tirzepatide is available on the BCUHB formulary. Therefore there are no minutes to record that it is not listed on the formulary.

20.  Do you consider primary care prescribers in Betsi Cadwaladr too stupid to prescribe a simple and straightforward diabetes treatment without a pathway, or is there some other reason you prevent them from prescribing medicine to patients in need, when primary care prescribers in other health boards can? If so, what is this other reason? It can't be money, as NICE TA shows that the intervention is cost effective and must be made available. What is the real reason to keep your patients at increased risk of a heart attack, stroke, amputation, blindness etc? Are you deliberately putting pressure on secondary care services in the hope that they will fail? Is this political?

Any healthcare professional can currently submit a purple application form to access and prescribe this treatment for individual patients as per the NICE TA. Once a Drugs and Therapeutics application is submitted, with inclusion into a pathway, the formulary status will be reviewed.

 
  
  

