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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 349/23/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 16th October 2023


Further to your request for information dated 20th September 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
Please provide the following information for the calendar years 2021 & 2022:

1. How many babies were diagnosed with a tongue-tie?
Please refer to the table below which includes the number of patients discharged with the ICD-10 code of: Q381 – Ankyloglossia in any diagnosis code position. 

	Year
	2021
	2022

	Patient Count
	78
	65


2. How many babies required the tongue-tie division procedure?
We do not hold this information. However, all babies suspected of having a restrictive lingual frenulum that is thought to be impacting on breastfeeding, are referred for rapid access, skilled assessment – objective criteria then treatment is determined. 
3. How many babies received the tongue-tie division procedure?
Please refer to the table below which includes patients between the ages of 0 – 4 who have had the OPCS Procedure code of: F263 - Incision of frenulum of tongue undertaken in 2021 and 2022. 
We have provided the data using ‘less than or equal to 5’ due to the low numbers involved.  If we were to release the exact figures for the criteria specified, they could be linked with other information available in the public domain, thus potentially risking identification of individuals.

	Year
	2021
	2022

	Total
	8
	≤5


4. What was the average waiting time for babies with tongue-tie to receive the tongue-tie division procedure?
We do not hold this information, however, from assessment to procedure we aim for a 1 week wait.  
5. What is the current waiting time for babies to receive the tongue-tie division?
We do not hold this information. However, we aim to see a mother and baby for assessment within about 3 days and offer division if required within 1 week of surgical referral.
6. How many babies currently have the tongue-tie diagnosis? 
We do not hold this information. 
7. How many babies are currently on the waiting list to receive the tongue-tie division? 
Not applicable (N/A) – we do not have a waiting list. 

Please note, the Health Board has a rapid access, triage assessment system in place, based around a team of 17 assessors. These are midwives & health visitors with advanced lactation qualifications, who have received additional training in specialist assessment. Therefore mothers and babies experiencing early breastfeeding issues are seen and assessed by their local assessor who can then arrange referral on for surgical treatment if it is needed. We do not have an open referral system/waiting list. 

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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