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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 214/23/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 2nd August 2023


Further to your request for information dated 20th July 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
1. The number of people that are currently on a waiting list to register at an NHS General Dental Service (GDS) provider within the Health Board, providing a breakdown of how many are:

a. Adults

b. Children

The Health Board does not hold the data in a format that would enable us to fully respond to this question as NHS GDS providers are independent contractors. The Health Board only holds data for the Community Dental Service which is a referral only service. Patients do not become registered with a specific dental practice, they are simply associated with the practice while engaging in dental care.
2. The number of people that are currently on a waiting list to register at a Community Dental Service provider within the health board, providing a breakdown of how many are:

a. Adults

b. Children

Please note, the information in the below table is related to referrals received into the service.

	Adults
	6,419

	Children
	5,140


3. The number of people that are on an NHS Community Dental Service waiting list to receive treatment, providing a breakdown of how many are:

a. Adults

b. Children

Please see above response to question 2, however please note that these figures are subject to change as there is a validation exercise underway currently.
4. The number of adults who are currently on an NHS General Dental Service waiting list to receive treatment, and have been waiting for:

a. up to 1 month

b. 1-3 months

c. 3-6 months

d. 6-12 months

e. 12-18 months

f. 18-24 months

g. 24 months+

The Health Board does not hold this data as it is held by individual dental practices who are independent contractors, and therefore manage their own waiting lists. 
5. The number of children who are currently on an NHS General Dental Service waiting list to receive treatment, and have been waiting for:

a. up to 1 month

b. 1-3 months

c. 3-6 months

d. 6-12 months

e. 12-18 months

f. 18-24 months

g. 24 months+

Please see response to question 4 above. 

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


