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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 187/23/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 31st July 2023 


Further to your request for information dated 10th July 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
1. How many patients were treated in the past 3 months for gastric and gastro-oesophageal junction cancer (any stage) with: 
	Treatment
	No. of Patients

	CAPOX (Capecitabine with Oxaliplatin) 
	≤5

	FOLFOX (Folinic acid, Fluorouracil and Oxaliplatin) 
	0

	Lonsurf (Trifluridine - tipiracil) 
	0

	Nivolumab in combination with Platinum (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin) and Fluoropyrimidine (5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine) 
	0

	Pembrolizumab in combination with Platinum (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin) and Fluoropyrimidine (5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine) 
	0

	Any other systemic anti-cancer therapy EOX, Paclitaxel, FLOT 
	≤5

	Palliative care only Not known
	This information is not recorded. 


We have provided the data using ‘equal or less than 5’ due to the low numbers involved.  If we were to release the exact figures for the criteria specified, they could be linked with other information available in the public domain, thus potentially risking identification of individuals.

2. How many patients were treated in the past 3 months for Oesophageal cancer (any stage) with: 

	Treatment
	No. of Patients

	Nivolumab monotherapy or combination with Ipilimumab 
	9

	Nivolumab in combination with Platinum (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin) and Fluoropyrimidene (5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine)
	0

	Pembrolizumab in combination with Platinum (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin) and Fluoropyrimidene (5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine) 
	≤5

	Platinum and Fluoropyrimidene based combination treatments (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin with 5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine) 
	13

	Any other systemic anti-cancer therapy 
	16

	Palliative care only 
	This information is not recorded.


We have provided the data using ‘equal or less than 5’ due to the low numbers involved.  If we were to release the exact figures for the criteria specified, they could be linked with other information available in the public domain, thus potentially risking identification of individuals.

3. How many patients were treated in the past 3 months for advanced/metastatic resected oesophageal cancer ONLY with:

	Treatment
	No. of Patients

	Nivolumab monotherapy or combination with Ipilimumab
	≤5

	Nivolumab in combination with Platinum (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin) and Fluoropyrimidene (5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine) 
	0

	Pembrolizumab in combination with Platinum (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin) and Fluoropyrimidene (5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine) 
	≤5

	Platinum and Fluoropyrimidene based combination treatments (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin with 5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine) 
	8

	Any other systemic anti-cancer therapy 
	≤5

	Palliative care only 
	This information is not recorded.


We have provided the data using ‘equal or less than 5’ due to the low numbers involved.  If we were to release the exact figures for the criteria specified, they could be linked with other information available in the public domain, thus potentially risking identification of individuals.

4. In the past 3 months, how many patients have been initiated* on the following agents for treatment for gastric, gastro-oesophageal junction or Oesophageal cancer: 

*Patients are considered initiated if they have not been treated in the previous 6 months with any of the drugs that are part of the named regimen.

	Treatment
	No. of Patients

	Nivolumab monotherapy or in combination with Ipilimumab
	0

	Nivolumab in combination with Platinum (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin) and Fluoropyrimidene (5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine)
	0

	Pembrolizumab in combination with Platinum (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin) and Fluoropyrimidene (5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine)
	0


5. Does your Health Board participate in any clinical trials for gastric cancer? If so, please provide the name of each trial and the number of patients taking part. 

None at present. 
6. Does your Health Board participate in any clinical trials for oesophageal cancer? If so, please provide the name of each trial and the number of patients taking part.

	Name
	No. of Patients Taking Part

	A randomised Phase II/III trial to study radiotherapy dose escalation in patients with oesophageal cancer treated with definitive chemoradiation with an embedded Phase II trial for patients with a poor early response using positron emission tomography (PET)
	22
(Please note, this is the number of patients who consented into the trial and does not represent the number currently still in the trial)



We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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