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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 182/23/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 1st August 2023 


Further to your request for information dated 7th July 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
1. How many babies were born within your Health Board between January 1st 2022 and December 31st 2022? 
5,437.

2. How many babies were diagnosed with ankyloglossia (tongue tie) between January 1st 2022 and December 31 2022 at your Health Board?

We are unable to provide a figure of those diagnosed within the asked timeframe as we do not hold diagnosis date electronically. However, we can confirm there was a total of 77 patients discharged with the ICD-10 code for ankyloglossia within the timeframe specified. 
3. On average how many days after birth was a tongue tie diagnosis made between January 1st 2022 and December 31st 2022? 

In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

This is not information that the Health Board records. Therefore, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to determine the average number of days after birth, that a diagnosis was made. From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate cost limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 19 hours to retrieve and review each patient notes of those diagnosed with ankyloglossia and calculate the number of days between birth and diagnosis. This figure is based on a timescale of 15 minutes per patient referral, there currently being 77 patient referrals to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 19 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £475. 

Section 12 is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.
4. How many babies diagnosed with tongue tie were referred for a frenotomy procedure (tongue tie division) between January 1st 2022 and December 31st 2022? 

Please see exemption provided as a response to question 3, which has exceeded the cost limit. 
5. Is the frenotomy procedure (tongue tie division) available to babies who are fully formula fed? 

Yes, on a medical, paediatric and surgical pathway. 
6. How many frenotomy procedures (tongue tie division) were carried out on babies at your Health Board between January 1st 2022 and December 31st 2022?

7. What was the average waiting time in days between diagnosis/ referral and a frenotomy procedure (tongue tie division) between January 1st 2022 and December 31st 2022? 

8. How many women had to wait 3 weeks or longer after a referral for a frenotomy procedure (tongue tie division) or their baby between January 1st 2022 and December 31st 2022? 
Please see exemption provided as a response to question 3, which has exceeded the cost limit. 

9. How many women waited more than 6 weeks, 8 weeks, 12 weeks and 16 weeks or longer for a frenotomy procedure (tongue tie division) for their baby between January 1st 2022 and December 31st 2022? 

None. 
10. What is the longest amount of time a women had to wait after a referral for a frenotomy procedure (tongue tie division) for their baby between January 1st 2022 and December 31st 2022? 
Please see exemption provided as a response to question 3, which has exceeded the cost limit. 

11. If there is no tongue tie division service in your Health Board, how many referrals were made to an alternative NHS Service for tongue tie division?

Not applicable. 
12. How many women declined the offer of a frenotomy procedure (tongue tie division) within the NHS between January 1st 2022 and December 31st 2022?
13. Of the women who declined the offer of a frenotomy procedure (tongue tie division) within the NHS between January 1st 2022 and December 31st 2022 are you aware how many sought treatment privately instead? 

This information is not recorded. 

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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