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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 172/23/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 18th August 2023 


Further to your request for information dated 06th July 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
Please provide information relating to the questions below for the machine types and years listed within Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB).
Machine types: MRI scanner, PET scanner, CT scanner, linear accelerator (LINAC) and Surgical Robots (both Versius and Da Vinci).
Years: 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022.

1. For each year and machine type, how many units were owned or leased? (Please also provide dates for new machines that were either commissioned or decommissioned within a year).

	Machine type
	Year and number of units owned or leased
	Machines commissioned or decommissioned within a year

	MRI Scanner
	2019, 2020 &
2021
	2022
	May 2019 - one scanner decommissioned and replaced.

December 2022- one scanner decommissioned and replaced in May 2023.



	
	3 x 1.5T Scanners

1 x 0.5T Weight Bearing Scanners – owned by the health board
March 2021 – 1 additional leased.

	From August 2022 a second MR scanner has been leased to cover the replacement of 1 machine This remains on site to support the backlog clearance.
	

	PET Scanner
	PETCT is provided as part of a contract by Alliance Medical LTD.

The Health Board does not hold the list of equipment provided or the capital cost. It is leased by a third party provider. 
	

	CT Scanner
	The Health Board owned 6 CT scanners From May 2018 to September 2020.
In September 2020 a 7th Machine was gifted to the Health Board as part of the Covid equipment provision. Thus from September 2020 to the current time the Health Board has had 7 CT scanners.
Oncology CT Simulator 1: 2019-2022 one installed March 2009 and was replaced April 2022 – the old one was removed January 2023.
	May 2020 one machine was decommissioned and replaced.

December 2022 one machine was decommissioned and replaced March 2023.

	LINAC
	In period 2019-2022 4 LINACs: Owned and accepted December 2010, December 2010, October 2013, July 2016. 
A replacement for one of the December 2010 LINACs was purchased February 2022 and accepted April 2023.
	

	Surgical Robots - Versius
	
	
	
	Contact started 1st April 2022. The annual contract value was £525k per annum, exc VAT. Unit remains in use by BCUHB. Not owned by BCUHB. 
	

	Surgical Robots - Da Vinci
	There are no Da Vinci robots in BCUHB.


2. For each machine that was either owned or leased between 2018 and 2022, please disclose a) the date of purchase, b) the capital value and c) whether the machine was still in use at the end of 2022 and, if not, the date it was decommissioned.
	Machine type
	Date of purchase
	Capital Value
	Machine in use at the end of 2022/date decommissioned

	MRI Scanner
	MRI Ysbyty Glan Clwyd weight bearing – 2014

MRI Ysbyty Glan Clwyd 1.5T – 2019

MRI Wrexham Maelor 2023

MRI Ysbyty Gwynedd

2017

Unable to give dates of purchase for leased equipment.
	Approximately million per MRI scanner plus enabling works costs.
	May 2019 - one scanner decommissioned and replaced.

December 2022- one scanner decommissioned and replaced in May 2023.



	PET Scanner
	This information is not held by the Health Board.

	CT Scanner
	CT1 Ysbyty Glan Clwyd – 2020

CT2 Ysbyty Glan Cwyd – 2016

CT1 Wrexham Maelor 2023

CT Wrexham Maelor – 2015
CT1 Ysbyty Gwynedd – 2013

CT2 Ysbyty Gwynedd – 2015

CT4 BCU owned modular – 2020

	Between £700k and £1 million per CT scanner plus enabling works costs.

The value of the replacement CT Simulator was £650k
	May 2020 one machine was decommissioned and replaced.

December 2022 one machine was decommissioned and replaced March 2023.



	LINAC
	In period 2019-2022 4 LINACs: Owned and accepted December 2010, December 2010, October 2013, July 2016. A replacement for one of the December 2010 LINACs was purchased February 2022 and accepted April 2023.

	The value of the replacement LINAC was £2.5m.

	

	Surgical Robots - Versius
	CMR robot which was procured by the National Robotics programme.
	Contact started 1st April 2022. The annual contract value was £525k per annum, exc VAT. Unit remains in use by BCUHB.
	

	Surgical Robots – Da Vinci


	There are no Da Vinci robots in BCUHB.


3. For each year and for each machine type, please provide details on the number of times they were used.

Table: Number of patient appointments for PET CT, Radiology CT and MRI 
	
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022

	PETCT
	747
	878
	1236
	1375

	MRI
	23442
	17099
	24379
	23672

	CT
	59355
	55142
	68304
	74389


Table: Number of patient appointments for 4 LINACs and Radiotherapy CT scanner in 2019-2022 period.

	
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022

	Oncology CT Simulator 1
	2111
	1965
	2039
	1964


	LINACs Machine
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022

	LINAC A
	7848
	6740
	6510
	6059

	LINAC B
	8061
	6789
	6424
	5948

	LINAC C
	8269
	7004
	6552
	6775

	LINAC D
	6744
	3702
	4459
	4321


Surgical Robots - Versius

18 cases conducted during 2022/23 financial year.
Surgical Robots - Da Vinci
There are no Da Vinci robots in BCUHB.
4. For each year and for each machine type, please provide details on their availability for use by number of scans/treatments/operations/procedures (apply when relevant).
MRI Scanners

All 1.5T scanners are used 7 days per week.
Weight bearing scanner - limited use and is being decommissioned.

PET Scanners

The PETCT initially was on a 2 day a week contract which has increased to 3 days since 2021, and currently is supplied between 3 and 4 days per week depending upon demand. 
CT Scanners

4 scanners used for 12 hours a day 7 days per week. 

An additional 3 scanners - 1 per District General Hospital (DGH) used 24/7.

LINACs
Please refer to the table in Question 3 above. 

For unplanned down time, no detailed records are being kept, but not taking into account brief clearing of interlocks, for the LINACs it would typically be a total of two to three days a year per machine.
Surgical Robots – Versius

The lease is for 200 cases per annum. Currently in use by Gynaecology and Colorectal departments. 
Surgical Robots - Da Vinci
There are no Da Vinci robots in BCUHB.

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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