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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 168/23/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 1st August 2023


Further to your request for information dated 5th July 2022, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request:
Please can you provide the following information about dentists and dental services in the health board area:
1. How many NHS registered dental practices were there in 2013?
2. How many NHS registered dental practices were there in 2023?
3. How many NHS registered dentists were there in 2013?
4. How many NHS registered dentists were there in 2023?
5. How many NHS registered dental patients were there in 2013?
6. How many NHS registered dental patients were there in 2023?
7. How many NHS registered dental patients were there in 2013 on a waiting list for treatment?
8. How many NHS registered dental patients were there in 2023 on a waiting list for treatment?
Our response: 
Please refer to the embedded document below for our responses in relation to the information requested. 
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We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


_1752393042.pdf
The following responses are provided within the context of Community Dental Services* and not high street NHS General Dental Practices.

Question

Community Dental Service Response

General Dental Service

Comments

1la) How many NHS registered
dental practices were there in
20137

As at 1% April 2013:

e 30 Community Dental Services
(CDS) Clinic sites, including x4
General Anaesthesia clinics
held at acute hospital sites.

As at 1% April 2013 there
were 83 General Dental
Services (GDS) practices

1b) How many NHS
registered dental practices
were there in 2023?

As at 1t April 2023:

e 29 CDS Clinics including x3
General Anaesthesia clinics
held at acute hospital sites.

As at 1%t April 2023 there
were 76 GDS practices

The General Anaesthetic service
at Llandudno Hospital transferred
to Yshyty Gwynedd.

2a) How many NHS registered
dentists were there in 2013?

For the financial year 2013/14:

e 28.9 Whole Time Equivalent
e 55 Headcount

We do not hold this
information, performer list is
managed by NHS Wales
Shared Services Partnership

Source: Welsh Government
workforce return 2013/14.

2b) How many NHS
registered dentists were there
in 20237

Current:

e 31.05 Whole Time Equivalent
e 44 Headcount

We do not hold this
information, performer list is
managed by NHS Wales
Shared Services Partnership

3a) How many NHS registered
dental patients were there in
20137

e Unknown

NHS dental patient
registration ceased in 2006.
Practices are only
responsible for the care of
patients whilst they are under
a course of treatment, have
another issue within two
months or have an item
under guarantee.

The CDS Soel Health (IT) system
does not include the reporting
capacity to confirm the number of
patients registered with CDS
clinics in previous years.

3b) How many NHS
registered dental patients

Current:

NHS dental patient
registration ceased in 2006.

Once registered patients remains
in the system. This figure includes
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were there in 20237

170,000 are ‘registered’ on the
Soel Health (IT) System

Practices are only
responsible for the care of
patients whilst they are under
a course of treatment, have
another issue within two
months or have an item
under guarantee.

potentially duplicates and inactive
patients.

4a) How many NHS registered
dental patients were there in
2013 on a waiting list for
treatment?

Unknown

We do not hold this
information, dental practices
manage their own waiting
lists, patients may join

several practices waiting lists.

Waiting lists were not recorded on
the CDS (IT) Soel Health system
in 2013; clinics maintained
manual records.

4b) How many NHS
registered dental patients
were there in 2023 on a
waiting list for treatment?

Unknown a piece of work is
being undertaken to pull
together a service waiting list
using the electronic patient
management system

We do not hold this
information, dental practices
manage their own waiting
lists, patients may join

several practices waiting lists.

* NB: As a referral service, the CDS differs from high street NHS dental practices that provide routine care and treatment for patients (eg.
patients cannot self-register with a clinic for treatment as they must be referred into the service by a health professional).
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