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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 109/23/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 29th June 2023


Further to your request for information dated 2nd June 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
1.      Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone number of the commissioner with responsibility for learning disabilities placements?
For questions 2 to 6, please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial years 2022/23 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2023/24.
2.      Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by    Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) in residential care. 
3.      Of the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by BCUHB in residential care, please provide the number that are in ‘in area’ placements and the number that are in ‘out of area’ placements. 
4.      Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by BCUHB in supported living. 
5.      Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who transitioned from children’s learning disabilities services into adult’s services - in total, into adult residential care services only, and into adult supported living services only. 
6.      Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who ‘stepped down’ from specialist inpatient hospital placements into adult residential care and supported living services. 
7.      Please provide BCUHB’s total expenditure on residential care and supported living for adults with learning disabilities for the financial year 2022/23, and budgeted expenditure for 2023/24.
8.      Please provide the highest, lowest, and average weekly rate paid by BCUHB for residential care placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years 2022/23 and 2023/24. If BCUHB has weekly rate bands, please also provide these.
9.      Please provide the highest, lowest, and average hourly rate paid by BCUHB for supported living placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years 2022/23 and 2023/24. If BCUHB has hourly rate bands, please also provide these.
Our response:
Please refer to the spreadsheet embedded below. 
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We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


Summary

		FOI Answers



		University Health Board (UHB): 		BCUHB

		Date:		6/7/23



		1. Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone number of the commissioner with responsibility for learning disabilities placements. 		Name		Job title		Telephone No.		Email Address

				William Willams 		Head Of Service Deliver And Clinical Operations Regional Specialist Services		03000 852706		Will.Williams@wales.nhs.uk



		2. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the UHB in residential care. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial year 2022/23 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2023/24.		2022/23		2023/24

		Total in residential care		115		98



		3. Of the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the UHB in residential care (q.2) please provide the number that are in ‘in area’ placements and the number that are in ‘out of area’ placements. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial year 2022/23 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2023/24.		2022/23		2023/24

		In area		85		70

		Out of area		30		28



		4. Please provide the total number of adults with learning disabilities funded by the UHB in supported living. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial year 2022/23 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2023/24.		2022/23		2023/24

		Total in supported living		54		52



		5. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who transitioned from children’s learning disabilities services into adult's services - in total, into adult residential care services only, and into adult supported living services only. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial year 2022/23 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2023/24.		2022/23		2023/24

		Total transitioned		5		0

		Transitioned to residential care		5		0

		Transitioned to supported living		0		0



		6. Please provide the number of adults with learning disabilities who ‘stepped down’ from specialist inpatient hospital placements into adult residential care and supported living services. Please supply this information as a snapshot at the end of the year for the financial year 2022/23 and the most up to date snapshot available for 2023/24.		2022/23		2023/24

		Stepped down into residential care		In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.
The Health Board does not hold the data in a format that would enable us to respond to your request to the level of detail required. As this is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to collate this data.  From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff approximately 45 hours to locate and review the notes of the 535 patients open to the learning disabilities team to establish which of those patients have either been stepped down into residential care or supported living. This figure is based on a timescale of 5 minutes per set of patient notes. Therefore, obtaining the data would work out at approximately 45 hours x £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £1,125.
As you will be aware this is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.


		Stepped down into supported living



		7. Please provide the UHB's total expenditure on residential care and supported living for adults with learning disabilities for the financial year 2022/23, and budgeted expenditure for 2023/24.		2022/23		2023/24

		Total expenditure on residential care		£7,526,790		£7,389,586

		Total expenditure on supported living		£2,967,458		£2,973,029



		8. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average weekly rate paid by the UHB for residential care placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years 2022/23 and 2023/24. If the UHB has weekly rate bands, please also provide these. 		2022/23		2023/24

		Highest weekly rate, £		£7,403		£7,921

		Lowest weekly rate, £		£38		£38

		Average weekly rate, £		£1,265		£1,268

		Weekly rate bands, £ (if used)		-		-



		9. Please provide the highest, lowest, and average hourly rate paid by the UHB for supported living placements for adults with a learning disability for each of the financial years 2022/23 and 2023/24. If the UHB has hourly rate bands, please also provide these. 		2022/23		2023/24

		Highest hourly rate, £		BCUHB does not hold this information.

		Lowest hourly rate, £

		Average hourly rate, £

		Hourly rate bands, £ (if used)














































