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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 082/23/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 25th July 2023


Further to your request for information dated 17th May 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
Please provide the following information for Betsi Cadwaladr University health Board (BCUHB).
1. Do you have local provisions for all to receive NHS Attention Deficit Hyperactivity Disorder (ADHD) services? If no, and if relevant, under the National Institute for Health and Care Excellence (NICE) guidelines, please detail on alternate services which the NHS will fund.

Children’s Services

ADHD assessments for children are undertaken within Neurodevelopmental Services. There is not a separate waiting list for ADHD / Autism – there is a combined Neurodevelopmental Service waiting list.
Adult Services
Assessment and treatment is carried out by Consultant Psychiatrists and will sit in the Local Primary Mental Health Support Service (LPMHSS) stream of service delivery.
2. The current waiting time for NHS adult ADHD diagnosis
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

This is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles or holds in a centralised location that is easily accessible. Therefore, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to determine how many patients out of the total number of referrals received are currently waiting to be diagnosed with ADHD. 
From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in approximately 131 hours to locate and review patient notes of the 1,569 referrals received into the service in April 2023 alone. This figure is based on a timescale of 5 minutes per patient record. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 131 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £3,275. 

3.  
The current waiting time for NHS child ADHD diagnosis

The Health Board does not hold a waiting list for ADHD assessments alone. The waiting list at the end of April 2023 was 3,306 children waiting for an ND assessment.
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

This is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles or holds for all areas under the remit of BCUHB. Therefore, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to determine how many children are awaiting a diagnosis for ADHD. From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate cost limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 276 hours to review each referral for those patients who are currently on the waiting list for an assessment by the children’s neurodevelopmental team. This figure is based on a timescale of 5 minutes per patient referral, there currently being 3,306 patient referrals to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 276 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £6,900. 
4. Number of adults on waiting list for ADHD diagnosis

Please refer to question 2 above. 
5. Number of children on waiting list for ADHD diagnosis

The Health Board does not hold a waiting list for ADHD assessments alone. Our total waiting list for ADHD / Autism Spectrum Disorder (ASD) assessments as of 30th April 2023 is 3,306. 
6. Based on the individual who is currently on the waiting list, what is the longest so far a patient has been waiting for an ADHD diagnosis? 

Children’s Services:

As of April 2023 - the longest wait was 252 weeks.
Adult Services: 

Please note that this information is recorded differently for each area covered by BCUHB, and an exact figure could not be established unless every patient file was reviewed. However, under the Health Board’s obligation to advise and assist, we have included an approximate figure for each area as below.

· East (Wrexham & Flintshire)
Approximately between 18-24 months. 
· Central (Denbighshire & Conwy)

Approximately between 6-28 weeks. 

· West (Anglesey & Gwynedd)
Approximately between 50-80 days.

7. How are the waiting lists ordered? Is it a first come first served basis? Or are patients added based on the scale of how symptoms affect them? Once on waiting list, is their position fixed or can they be moved up or down?
Children’s Services:
Waiting lists are based on date of referral and patients are seen in that order. The service does not have urgent waiting lists; patients may be signposted to other services as required.
Adult Services:
Patients are placed on the waiting list as they present – i.e. if their symptoms are solely neurodiverse as stated in their referral, provided that there are no risks / co-morbid mental health concerns. If patients have a co-existing mental illness(es) and the referral requests an ADHD assessment as well, then the patient will be seen as per usual process. 

Patients can be moved up the list as needed based on urgency but this rarely happens. 
8. If a patient moves out of your region, are they removed from the waiting list? 

Children’s Services

Yes, patients would be removed once the service has been advised of a change in circumstances.
Adult Services
If a patient moves out of area they will be removed from the list. However, they will be supplied a letter advising them to register with a GP surgery in their new area. 
9. If a patient moves into the region, are they inserted at the bottom of the waiting list?
Children’s Services

If the patient has moved from any of the areas within BCUHB, (Central, East or West) then they would be put on the waiting list at the original referral date in the area they moved from. Out of region referrals are reviewed by clinicians and a decision made as to whether referral criteria is met, and if so, placed on at date of previous referral.
Adult Services

The patient will be inserted on the list as per every other referral. If they have been prescribed medication for ADHD then they are seen quicker. This is in order to commence shared care. Their notes are requested from the area they have come from directly or via their GP. 
10. Budget value in GBP and percentage allocated to ADHD services 
The Health Board does not have specific funding for ADHD as funding is provided across the broader children’s neurodevelopmental service. 
For adult services, there is no specific budget for ADHD. 
11. Do your services operate under 'Right to Choose'? 
Both child and adult services do not operate under ‘Right to Choose’.
12. If relevant, what is the cost to the NHS of using private practices for diagnosis? 

Children’s Services

Due to demand, services often go to tender for private assessments to undertake assessments on our behalf. At present children’s services are going through a tender exercise. 
Adult Services
Adult services do not use private companies for ADHD assessments and diagnosis. 
13. Do you accept private diagnoses and shared care? 
Children’s Services

Any private diagnoses have to be validated by internal clinicians to ensure that the assessment has met NICE guidelines before being accepted into the service.
Any patients being placed on the ND service ADHD medication pathway would have to wait for a medication appointment and the ND doctor would assess their medication needs. They would not automatically be placed on a shared care agreement unless the GP agreed to do this without ND involvement.
Adult Services

If patient sees a private psychiatrist, then the expectation will be for the referring GP to agree shared care with the private treating psychiatrist. If the patient is then referred to the NHS they will join the waitlist.
14. How many staff are trained to diagnose and treat ADHD within your region.
Children’s services:
The assessment pathway and medication pathway are 2 different pathways. Clinicians are trained to assess ADHD and then children are referred to the medication pathway when they have received a diagnoses of ADHD.  
	Area
	Whole Time Equivalent (WTE) Staff in post – ADHD Diagnosis
	WTE Staff in post – ADHD Treatment

	Central
	8.1
	10.6

	East
	10.4
	10.4

	West
	4.0
	4.8


Adult services:

	Area
	WTE Staff in post – ADHD Diagnosis
	WTE Staff in post – ADHD Treatment

	Central
	6.0
	6.0

	East
	24.2
	24.2

	West
	3.0
	4.0


15. Are you making any improvements to these services / do you have any plans to improve these services?
Children’s Services 
Children’s Services are currently going through a tender exercise to increase capacity to undertake assessments. However, like all ND services this will not meet demand or help to sustain services. We are working very closely with Welsh Government who have undertaken a ‘Demand & Capacity’ review. This work has identified a number of key focus areas for all Health Boards to review and develop pilots for new ways of working to transform services to become sustainable and fit for the future. WG are providing additional funding for piloting these new ways of working.
Internally, we have set up a transformation programme for Childrens ND services to support the work identified by Welsh Government, and by our internal teams.  We are reviewing ways of working both within our service and also with our partner organisations (including Local Authorities and Education), across the region to support and sustain these changes. These projects will include (but are not limited to), workforce, pre and post diagnosis, performance, transition from child to adult services, and digital, to enable us to focus on a needs led service. Our programme of work will align to both regional and national workstreams.
Adult Services
A neurodevelopmental work plan is in progress and a pathway for Adult Services should be clarified by September / October 2023. 
16. Does the region have targets relating to ADHD care and the aforementioned points? If so what are these? Are they being met? 

There is not a specific target for ADHD for either adults or children. 

Children’s services do have an ND Target: 80% of children young people waiting less than 26 weeks to start an assessment.  Due to demand outweighing capacity, this target is not being met.  We are working with WG regarding a ‘Demand & Capacity’ review.
17. If a patient was presenting with severe depression and based on the ADHD pre assessment undertaken by a GP they showed high likelihood of having ADHD. Would this affect any of the answers to the above points? I.e. would they have access to more support/earlier ADHD diagnosis? 

In children’s services there are no urgent waiting lists for assessments; however the patient would be signposted as required to other services, such as CAMHS.
In adult services, if there is a co-existing mental illness then the patient will need to be assessed by the Community Mental Health Team (CMHT) as required. The level of risk the patient presents with will dictate the urgency of the appointment. The service would focus on treating the mental health condition in the first instance, given potential risk to self. ADHD assessment would only be undertaken once the mental health problem had resolved.  This may also lead to accessing a clinic appointment sooner, based on prioritising clinical need. 

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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