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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 079/22/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 23rd June 2023


Please accept my sincere apologies for the delay. Further to your request for information dated 15th May 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
1.    How many patients have been treated for advanced (FIGO Stages III and IV) ovarian (epithelial ovarian, fallopian tube or primary peritoneal) cancer over the last 3 months within your Health Board? If none, do you refer advanced ovarian cancer patients to another Health Board/Trust? If so which one?
11 patients have been treated for advanced ovarian cancer over the last 3 months within Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB).
2.    How many ovarian cancer patients (any stage) have been treated in the last 3 months with the following:   
Please note, we have provided the data using ‘less than 5’ due to the low numbers involved.  If we were to release the exact figures for the criteria specified, they could be linked with other information available in the public domain, thus potentially risking identification of individuals.

	Treatment
	Number of patients treated

	Paclitaxel in combination with a platinum-based compound
	24

	Platinum-based therapy alone (cisplatin or carboplatin)
	16

	Bevacizumab in combination with paclitaxel and carboplatin
	<5

	Olaparib
	10

	Olaparib + Bevacizumab
	<5

	Niraparib
	18

	Rucaparib
	<5


3.     Does BCUHB participate in any clinical trials for the treatment of ovarian cancer?  If so, please provide the name of each trial along with the number of patients taking part

BCUHB does not have any open drug treatment trials for Ovarian Cancer currently.
We have one research study currently open. This is preventative, not a treatment trial called PROTECTOR: Preventing Ovarian Cancer through early Excision of Tubes and late Ovarian Removal (IRAS 237992). It is open in Ysbyty Gwynedd and has recruited 6 participants to date.

4.    If data for HRD (homologous recombination deficiency) testing is available, please provide how many HRD positive patients were treated in the last 3 months with:
· Olaparib  
· Olaparib + Bevacizumab
· Niraparib  
· Other treatments
This information is not recorded on our cancer database and is therefore not available.
5.     If data for HRD (homologous recombination deficiency) and BRCA testing is available, please provide how many HRD positive BRCA mutated patients were treated in the last 3 months with:
· Olaparib  
· Olaparib + Bevacizumab
· Niraparib  
· Other treatments
This information is not recorded on our cancer database and is therefore not available.

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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