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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 018/23/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 28th April 2023


Further to your request for information dated 12th April 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
1. How many members of Betsi Cadwaladr Health Board staff are currently off work
In terms of open, current sickness absence we have the following numbers, based on data as at 31/03/2023:
	Absence Reason
	Headcount

	S11 Back Problems
	48

	S12 Other musculoskeletal problems
	102

	Grand Total
	150


2. Or on restricted duties due to MSK (musculoskeletal) problems
The Health Board does not hold this information on the Electronic Staff Record.  
3. And are unable to access Physiotherapy through their workplace because they have a GP in England?
The Health Board does not record this data in the Electronic Staff Record.  

There is no residency based access to physio. It is open to all employees. 


We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


