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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 009/23/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 28th April 2023 


Further to your request for information dated 4th April 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request: 
Please complete the attached document in relation to staff training in Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB). 
Our response: 
Please refer to the embedded document below for our responses in relation to the information requested. 
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We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


We are writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request information about staff training in your hospital. We would be grateful if you could help with the following (some hospitals have this information available through electronic staff records systems, some through training and clinical skills departments and some through individual directorates). Please forward this to your freedom of information officer if you do not have the relevant knowledge to answer the questions yourself:



		Is fire safety training available to your staff?  

		Yes



		Do you keep staff training records for fire safety training? 



If yes, are they in an electronic form that can be interrogated (such as an electronic staff record)? 

		Yes 





Yes 



		What percentage of your staff have completed fire safety training within the last 12 months?

		47.5 %  (9785 completions/passed April 22 to April 23)



Please note Fire Safety is a 2-year competency which at the end of March 2023 was 84.3% completion.



		If you are able to separate out data for clinical and non-clinical staff…



· What percentage of your clinical staff have completed fire safety training within the last 12 months?



· What percentage of your non-clinical staff have completed fire safety training within the last 12 months?

		





10.1  % (2083 completions/passed)







37.4 % (7702 completions/passed)







		Is human factors training available to your staff?  

		Yes however this is a new and developing area for the Health Board. 





		Do you keep staff training records for human factors training? 



If yes, are they in an electronic form that can be interrogated (such as an electronic staff record)? 

		No central list is maintained at present.





No



		What percentage of your staff have completed human factors training within the last 12 months?

		We do not hold a percentage figure. We estimate around 40 staff have been trained in advanced human factors and around 40 staff in basic human factors. This would be roughly 0.2% of our workforce. 





		If you are able to separate out data for clinical and non-clinical staff…



· What percentage of your clinical staff have completed human factors training within the last 12 months?



· What percentage of your non-clinical staff have completed human factors training within the last 12 months?

		We do not hold this information. 
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We are   writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request information  about  staff training  in   your hospital .  We   would be grateful if you could help with the   following   (some  hospitals have th is information available through  electronic  staff records systems , some  through  training and clinical skills departments   and   some through individual directorates ) .  Please forward this to your freedom of information officer if you do not have the relevant  knowledge  to answer the questions   yourself :    


Is fire safety training available to your staff?    Yes  


Do you keep staff training records for fire  safety training?      If yes, are they in an electronic form that can  be interrogated (such as an electronic staff  record)?   Yes        Yes    


What percentage of  your staff have  completed fire safety training within the last  12 months?  47.5   %    (9785 completions/passed April 22 to  April 23)     Please note  Fire Safety is a 2 - year competency  which at the end of March 2023 was 84.3%  completion.  


If you are able to  separate out data for  clinical and non - clinical staff…        What percentage of your clinical staff  have completed fire safety training within  the last 12 months?        What percentage of your non - clinical  staff have completed fire safety training  within the last 12   months?        10.1     %   (2083 completions/passed)         37.4 %   (7702 completions/passed)  


 


Is human factors training available to your  staff?    Yes  however this is a new and developing area  for the Health Board.     


Do you keep staff training records for human  factors training?      If yes, are they in an electronic form that can  be interrogated (such as an electronic staff  record)?   No central list is maintained at present.       No  


What percentage of your staff have  compl eted  human factors  training within the  last 12 months?  We do not hold a percentage figure. We  estimate around 40 staff have been trained in  advanced human factors and around 40 staff in  basic human factors. This would be roughly  0.2% of our workforce.     


If you are able to separate out data for  clinical and non - clinical staff…    We do not hold this information.   



