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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 659/22/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 5th May 2023 


Please accept my sincere apologies for the delay. Further to your request for information dated 25th March 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
Please can you give figures for each of the below for the last 5 years. If possible, for 2021 & 2022 could you give all of the above data by COVID-19 vaccination status (0/1/2/3/4 doses) or state if you do not record vaccination status.
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.
Due to the way Covid-19 vaccination status is recorded, we are unable to provide the vaccination status of the patient during the time of the below information, only their status at present time. Therefore, for total live births alone we would have to carry out a specific exercise to determine the number of patients who have given birth to the figures within question one, to then determine the vaccination status of those patients while admitted. From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate cost limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 494 hours to review each patient record. This figure is based on a timescale of 5 minutes per record, there currently being 5,934 records to review for total live births in 2018 alone. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 494 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £12,350. 

Section 12 is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.
1. Total live births
	
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022

	Total Live Births
	5934
	5760
	5551
	5465
	5307


2. Total still births
	
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022

	
	7
	6
	8
	3
	3

	
	1
	2
	3
	
	

	
	2
	4
	
	2
	3

	
	10
	10
	7
	3
	6

	
	2
	2
	1
	1
	1

	Total Still Born Total
	22
	24
	19
	9
	13


3. Total intrapartum still births
Please see table above provided for question 2. We are unable to break this information down to intrapartum still births as the data is not recorded to this detail. 
4. Total neonatal deaths to 28 days

	
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022

	Neonatal Deaths
	11
	11
	5
	2
	6


5. Total preterm births (<37 weeks)
	
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022

	
	75
	86
	85
	129
	92

	
	23
	15
	17
	27
	27

	
	47
	52
	49
	60
	64

	
	91
	100
	110
	99
	84

	
	30
	25
	35
	19
	22

	
	
	2
	2
	1
	1

	
	
	2
	
	
	

	Total Pre-Term Births Total
	266
	282
	298
	335
	290


6. Total maternal deaths
	
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022

	
	1
	2
	1
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	1

	Total Maternal Deaths Total
	1
	2
	1
	
	1


7. Total maternal collapses / cardiac arrests
	
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022

	
	6
	3
	8
	5
	3

	
	2
	2
	1
	1
	1

	
	8
	9
	4
	5
	4

	
	7
	10
	8
	7
	10

	
	
	5
	3
	2
	2

	Total Maternal Collapses Total
	23
	29
	24
	20
	20


8. Total postpartum haemorrhage >1.5l
	
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022

	PPH ≥1500 mls and over
	293
	271
	257
	227
	210


9. Evacuation of retained products of conception (ERPCs)

	
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022

	Evacuation
	86
	96
	90
	121
	97

	
	17
	19
	25
	28
	23

	
	70
	74
	54
	92
	97

	
	166
	129
	122
	170
	144

	
	36
	40
	35
	34
	33

	
	
	
	1
	1
	

	
	2
	2
	
	
	1

	Evacuation Total
	377
	360
	327
	446
	395


10. Attendance numbers for early pregnancy clinics
We are unable to provide this data as this information is not routinely recorded in a central location. 
11. Do you record covid-19 vaccination status in your electronic maternity records?

Yes. 


We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


