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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 598/22/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 14th April 2023


Further to your request for information dated 21st February 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
1. How many NHS continuing healthcare assessments have been undertaken in each of the past 5 years? 

2. How many reviews of NHS continuing healthcare assessments were requested and how many resulted in a change in eligibility for NHS continuing healthcare in each of the past 5 years? 

3. How long did it take to determine the outcome of reviews of NHS continuing healthcare assessment decisions in each of the past 5 years? 

4. What was the longest time between a review of a NHS continuing healthcare assessment and the date the review was requested, indicating if the case is still ongoing, in each of the past 5 years?
 
Please find embedded below our response to questions 1 to 4 above:
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We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg




598/22/FOI response



Apologies for the delay in responding to this FOI: We have chosen to clarify and answer these questions to the very best of our ability in the essence of candour and transparency despite having sufficient legitimacy to support a response of ‘this information is not kept in this format’ approach. 

Please note not all the information requested is collected locally and are not able to give details from prior to digitalisation of records in 2019. 

Of significant concern even following clarification of the questions there is a concern that the nature of the question is not aligned to the structure and functions of nationally required and CHC processes and hence the comments section must be viewed with the responses for understanding of the true/ actual responses being given. 



		FOI questions and questioner clarification

		BCUHB response 

		Context and clarification of response 



		Question 1  - How many NHS continuing healthcare assessments have been undertaken in each of the past 5 years? 

 ‘NHS continuing healthcare assessments’ would include the following:
assessment of eligibility commencing when the individual’s ongoing needs are known using the CHC decision support tool (DST). This includes new referrals and existing patients whose needs increase and trigger for a full DST at their routine review.

 



		

New CHC Referrals triggering a DST 

		Referral Year

		Patients



		2019

		10



		2020

		18



		2021

		20



		2022

		96



		Grand Total

		143







This excludes DST resulting from reviews of existing patients e.g. supported under a joint funded or FNC funding stream, but not previously eligible for CHC. 



		Review Year

		Patients



		2019

		174



		2020

		263



		2021

		198



		2022

		157



		Grand Total

		802







Grand total for both categories; 945 for 2019-2022 inclusive. 



Data for 2018 is not available.  

		New referral data is extracted from the patient referrals to CHC teams and based on 

1. Referral Outcome Including;	Accepted Checklist (outside provider doing DST; CHC; Checklist Accepted (awaiting hospital DST); Checklist Agreed; Covid-19 Interim Funded Agreed (checklist); C2RA Checklist; Fast Track Agreed; Fast Track ED Agreed; FNC; Joint Funding; Progress to Panel										

2.  Which Review	 including Checklist - 3 week clinical review; Checklist ( excluding MHLD referrals)- DST Eligibility; Covid-19 4 week review; S2RA - DST Eligibility; Nursing Needs Assessment (1st review after checklist)	



Of note

a) The checklist is not adopted in all HB’s in Wales and this information will not be directly comparable to other HB’s who may have responded. 

b) There may be a number of CHC assessments undertaken throughout North Wales (and the rest of the UK) that did not result in a referral to the CHC team as the assessment outcome was negative for eligibility. These maybe undertaken at any of the 1000’s of patient front Multi-disciplinary team reviews that are appropriately undertaken across health and social care every year. It is not possible to estimate this portion of CHC assessments. 									



		Question 2 – How long did it take to determine the outcome of reviews of NHS continuing healthcare assessment decisions in each of the past 5 years? 



I am seeking the time to undertake reviews of CHC decisions where the decision has been disputed.

		

2019-2022 Inclusive there have been 40 family appeals recorded of which 5  are currently active 



2019-2022 inclusive there have been 70 interagency disputes recorded.  





We are unable to give a historical account of disputes by year or length of resolution time other than the number of cases as a total between and including 2019-2022.

		‘ Disputes’ is a multi purpose, multi process generic term covering a number of scenarios. The 2 most common types of dispute are 



1. Family appeals of CHC due process: This is a required part of the CHC Framework in Wales. It follows a prescribed process including where possible evidence of disparity is established an Independent Review Panel. 

2. Interagency funding Dispute: This is where the HB and LA (usually) do not agree on the funding amount commissioned, the split of funding for joint packages of care or the LA disputes the outcome of the CHC panel where the HB have ultimate decision making in the CHC Framework. 



Disputes do not delay patient care delivery. Some disputes such as interagency disputes resolution may be supported pragmatically at a high level financial conversation and not historically tied back to individual cases where the patient had no financial impact. 





		Question 3 - How many reviews of NHS continuing healthcare assessments were requested and how many resulted in a change in eligibility for NHS continuing healthcare in each of the past 5 years

I am seeking information on the number of CHC decisions made by the Health Board which are subsequently disputed.



		This information is not recorded.

		



		Question 4 – What was the longest time between a review of a NHS continuing healthcare assessment and the date the review was requested, indicating if the case is still ongoing, in each of the past 5 years?

I simply want to know how long it took for the outcome the longest review of a disputed CHC decision from the time the review of that decision was requested.



		This information is not recorded.
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