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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 582/22/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 16th March 2023


Further to your request for information dated 15th February 2023, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
1. Does Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board’s (BCHUB) employment contract for international nurse recruits contain a repayment clause which requires the nurse to pay monies to the Health Board in order to be released from its employment within a certain time frame? 

Yes.

2. What is the time frame from the start of the employment contract date that the   repayment clause remains valid?

This is 36 months in total, and is based on a sliding scale where the percentage reclaimed decreases at set intervals. Please refer to table below. 
	Time elapsed
	Percentage of benefit to be reclaimed

	>12 months
	100%

	12-18 months
	75%

	18-24 months
	50%

	24-36 months
	25%

	<36 months
	0%


3. What is the Health Board’s repayment fee amount for internationally recruited nurses in 2023?

There is no set repayment fee. International nurses receive a package to support their relocation to the UK. This package incorporates both fixed and variable costs, some of which are reclaimable. The sum reclaimable decreases on a sliding scale basis, where the percentage reclaimed decreases at set intervals as per the table provided in question 2 above.

4. What was the repayment fee amount in 2018, 2019, 2020, 2021 and 2022?  (Please specify what this changed from/to in any of these years).
The Health Board does not hold the information requested for the years prior to 2020. However, we have included the data we have recorded for the financial years 2021/2022 and 2022/2023.

	Year
	Repayment Fee

	2021/2022
	£9,395.50

	2022/2023
	£25,276.20


5. How many internationally recruited nurses have left the Health Board and had to pay repayment fees over the last five years?

The Health Board does not hold the information requested for the years prior to 2020. However, we have included the data we have recorded for the financial years 2021/2022 and 2022/2023.

	Year
	Number of nurses

	2021
	5

	2022
	21



We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


