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	 Ein cyf / Our ref: 499/22/FOI


	Dyddiad / Date: 9th February 2023


Further to your request for information dated 8th January 2023, which was receipted on the 10th January 2023. Please accept our apologies for this information being presented past its deadline. I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request and our response:
Following on from previous requests and to bring my review to a close could I please request under the FOI Act the following elements:
Following our research, we have established that you are referring to request reference numbers 369/22/FOI, 370/22/FOI, 371/22/FOI and 394/22/FOI.

1. Interim management - of those that have been highlighted previously could you please advise how many working days have been completed in North Wales ie on BCUHB sites and not out of area for effectiveness, for the following roles, taking into account an average working week of 37.5 hrs - 40hrs a week over a 12 month period
· Interim Regional Delivery Director
· Interim deputy Medical Director
· Interim Vascular Network Manager
· Interim Associate Director for Planned Care
· Interim Associate Director for Unscheduled Care, 

The individuals referenced in previous responses were on senior worker contracts and expected to work autonomously. The Health Board does not keep a roster of senior managers so the days worked on site is not routinely recorded. However, where possible, we have provided information based on the records we do hold.
Interim Director of Regional Delivery.  We hold the number of days worked on site from September 2022 up to December 2022, and during this period they worked 22 days on site, out of 91 days worked. 
Interim Vascular Network Manager.  The number of days required to be worked on site is not stipulated in the contract for this worker. The days worked on site is not recorded in BCUHB systems.
Interim Deputy Medical Director. The individual reported in our previous FOI response is local to North Wales and was on an employed contract for this role. Whilst it is not explicit in their contract, it is expected the majority of their time was spent on site.  
Associate Director of Planned Care Delivery. The number of days required to be worked on site is not stipulated in the contract for this worker. The days worked on site is not recorded in BCUHB systems.
Programme Director for Unscheduled Care. The number of days required to be worked on site is not stipulated in the contract for this worker. The days worked on site is not recorded in BCUHB systems.
2. Of those listed above can you 100% accurately confirm when they have been on call when they have been based in North Wales at the time of being on call, as per consultants.  For example, 30 minutes from site.

Unfortunately, we do not record the information in a way to 100% accurately confirm this.
3. The interims listed above, I note on reviewing NHS jobs, the posts do not appear in the archives, how have they been advertised to change them from interim to substantive to reduce additional costs associated with agency staff

We are unable to comment on how NHS Jobs archive posts as the system is not managed by the Health Board.  

Interim Director of Regional Delivery. This post was advertised on NHS Jobs under a different title and has been advertised twice. Firstly, the Deputy Director of Integrated Clinical Delivery – Regional Services, was advertised in August 2022 but we did not appoint to the role. Subsequently, the role was re-titled to Chief Operating Officer and re-advertised in December 2022. Unfortunately, we also did not appoint to this role. However, the post will be re-advertised following a review of the role and job description. 
Interim Vascular Network Manager. This post was advertised in September 2021 but was not successfully recruited to. The post will be advertised again in February 2023.  
Interim Deputy Medical Director. This post was advertised internally in October 2022 but was not appointed to on a substantive basis. The post will be advertised externally in February 2023.
Associate Director of Planned Care Delivery. This post was advertised in January 2023 and is undergoing shortlisting.
Programme Director for Unscheduled Care. This post was advertised in August 2022 and recruited to.
4. In light of the above interims financial costs aligned, can you confirm that forward thinking 5 year planning is in place for both planned care and unscheduled care and aware of the financial losses aligned to Regional Treatment Centres (RTCs) currently.

There are two forward thinking long-term Health Board plans that incorporate both Planned Care and Unscheduled Care.

Living Healthier, Staying Well (LHSW) is our overarching long term strategy (ten years) for health and well-being and was published in 2018 following a programme of extensive engagement (see, Living Healthier, Staying Well 2018).  LHSW describes our long-term objectives for health and well-being and incorporates three main themes for which we identified priority actions to be worked on in the first years of the strategy.  They include:

• Improving health and reducing health inequalities - a focus on helping people make healthy lifestyle choices.

• Providing care as close to home as possible – priority areas include offering independence and control via digital healthcare and technology, the development of Community Resource Teams (one point of assessment and co-ordinated care and support) and social prescribing (non-clinical activities and support in the community that improve well-being).

• Care when your health needs are more serious – this includes providing better outcomes for patients, easier access to services, early diagnosis and treatment and offering more alternatives to hospital care.

LHSW provided the basis for the development of the Clinical Services Strategy (appendices available on request), which was published in 2022.  In preparation for the development of the Clinical Services Strategy (CSS), we undertook significant follow-up engagement in 2021 with the public of north Wales to test whether the goals set out in LHSW remain relevant, three years on, and in the light of the changed environment brought about by the COVID-19 pandemic.  The engagement exercise reaffirmed the Health Board’s goals although participants highlighted some areas that require further strengthening such as the need for a greater focus on improving physical, emotional and mental health.   The CSS provides us with a framework to help shape the future direction and agree our strategic intensions for clinical services in north Wales.  The fundamental purpose of the CSS is to help us to make better and more informed choices about the way in which we provide our services.  Moving forward implementation plan(s) will use the principles in the CSS to help us restore timely access to services and to ensure a good strategic fit across the whole health care system including the urgent and emergency care programme, planned care and major capital schemes.   
In terms of the Regional Treatment Centre (RTC) proposal, this is being managed through the establishment of an RTC Programme Board, which reports to the Medical Director/Deputy Chief Executive of the Health Board, in their role as the Senior Responsible Owner (SRO) for the RTC Programme.

The RTC Programme has a defined Programme budget for the current financial year (as part of the Health Board’s Integrated Medium Term Plan).  The financial position is reviewed regularly by the RTC financial leads and progress is reported to the RTC Programme Board. The RTC Programme is operating within its agreed budget limits, both on a month by month and on a full year forecast basis. 

The RTC Programme Board includes clinical representation and subject matter experts for planned care, along with representatives for workforce; estates; communication and engagement; and finance. This enables the programme to connect and communicate with corresponding elements of the Health Board’s infrastructure as the RTC plan develops. Members of the RTC Programme Board also meet regularly with representatives from Welsh Government to update them on the progress of the RTC proposals.

We are also following the Welsh Government policy (2021-2026) Six Goals for Urgent and Emergency Care.


We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


