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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 158/22/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 5th September 2022


Further to your request for information dated 21st July 2022, I am pleased to provide the following response. Please accept our apologies for the delay.
Your request and our response:

Please provide:

1. The number of A&E attendances on July 18, 2022 and July 19, 2022, with a primary or secondary diagnosis of:
· T67 Effects of heat and light

· L55 Sunburn 
BCUHB do not record attendances using the codes provided however under our duty to advise and assist please find below all attendances for the national coding of sunburn ‘07E’.
	Complaint
	18 July 2022
	19 July 2022

	Sunburn
	2
	1


2. The number of finished admission episodes on July 18, 2022 and July 19, 2022, with a primary or secondary diagnosis of:
· T67 Effects of heat and light

· L55 Sunburn 
BCUHB do not record attendances using the above codes provided however under our duty to advise and assist please find below all attendances for the national coding of sunburn ‘07E’.

	Complaint
	18 July 2022
	19 July 2022

	Sunburn
	1
	1


3. The number of occasions on July 18, 2022, and July 19, 2022, where an occupied ward or clinical area had a daily maximum temperature exceeding 26˚C. Please include each occupied ward or clinical area having a daily maximum of over 26˚C as one incident (e.g. if two wards exceeded the daily maximum temperature for two days and one clinical area exceeded the threshold for one day then the number of occasions to be reported is five).

Unfortunately, we do not hold this data for Glan Clwyd Hospital or Ysbyty Gwynedd, for the 18th and 19th July 2022, because the current systems in use do not store the information for longer than 14 days. However, we can confirm that there were 71 occasions within Wrexham Maelor Hospital where the temperature exceeded 26˚C.

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


