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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 194/21/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 31st August 2021



Further to your request for information dated 30th July 2021, I am pleased to provide the following response.  Please accept our sincere apologies for the delay.
Your request and our response:
I would like to request the following under the Freedom of Information Act 2000:

1. The number of children under 18 admitted to hospitals in Wales because of obesity in the calendar years of 2019, 2020 and 2021 (up until the most recent figures).
Please note, we can only provide data for Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) and not for the whole of Wales.

Between 1st January 2019 to 30th June 2021 which is the latest data available there were 7 children under the age of 18 who were admitted to a hospital within BCUHB with a primary diagnosis of obesity.
2. Please provide a breakdown of age if possible. 
	Age (Years)
	2019
	2020
	2021

	7
	0
	0
	<5

	8
	<5
	0
	0

	10
	<5
	0
	0

	13
	<5
	0
	<5

	14
	<5
	0
	0


We have provided the data using ‘less than 5’ due to the low numbers involved.  If we were to release the exact figures for the criteria specified, they could be linked with other information available in the public domain, thus potentially risking identification of individuals.
3. Please provide details of the individual’s weight at the time of referral if possible.
	Age (Years)
	Weight

	Patient A
	120kg

	Patient B
	110kg

	Patient C
	104.3kg

	Patient D
	Not recorded

	Patient E
	Not recorded 

	Patient F
	Not recorded 

	Patient G
	Not recorded


Please note, the order of patients in the above table is not the same as the table in question 1 above.   Where a patient’s weight was not recorded on admission, this was due to the patient being admitted via a specialty other than Paediatrics, e.g. Community Dental.






 


 












We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


