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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 166/21/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 10th August 2021 


Further to your request for information dated 13th July 2021, I am pleased to provide the following response. 

Your request and our response: 
Fast track Continuing Healthcare (CHC) funding enables people to be cared for outside of hospital at the end of their lives if their condition is deteriorating rapidly and may have entered a terminal phase. Guidance for Welsh Health Boards recommends that fast track CHC packages be commissioned within 48 hours of an application being made, this supports patients to be cared for at home or in the community and spend no more time in hospital at the end of life than they need to.
1. During the financial years 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21 how many applications for fast track CHC did Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) receive? 
Please note ‘fast track’ referrals can relate to end of life care, but can also be used for crisis support arrangements in exceptional circumstances.
	2018/2019
	2019/2020
	2020/2021

	512
	544
	392


2. During the financial years 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21 how many applications for fast track CHC did BCUHB fund? 
Please note in 2019/20 some non-urgent CHC referrals triaged by CHC teams were deemed to require fast track care delivery as part of the service improvements, therefore there were more applications funded than received. 
	2018/2019
	2019/2020
	2020/2021

	512
	616
	321


3. During the financial years 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21, how many applications for fast track CHC did BCUHB reject?
Please note that fast track referrals are taken on referral trust without prejudice with a follow up review usually every 2 weeks. Where fast track is no longer appropriate at follow up review e.g. the immediate care package crisis passed, or the end of life decision deemed to be taken prematurely, the care delivery will proceed to full needs assessment and full CHC assessment where triggered. 
	2018/19
	2019/20
	2020/21

	0
	72 

fast track referrals moved to routine CHC care on triage
	71
 fast track referrals moved to routine CHC care on triage


4. During the financial years 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21, what were the main reasons for rejecting fast track CHC applications?
N/A
5. What was the average time period in BCUHB in days/hours from the point at which a fast track CHC application was received to the care package being provided for the financial years 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21? 
Provided in the chart below is the average wait in days from when a Fast track CHC application was received in BCUHB to the care package being provided, from 1st September 2020 to 30th June 2021. Please note there are some cases where patient choice, best interests and clinical recommendation is not to move a patient in 48 hours, therefore one significant delay can impact the average data. Please note the information requested was not recorded prior to September 2020. This is a live data trend and the dip in July 2021 represents incomplete July data at the time of recovery. 
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6. What was the average time period in days/hours from the point at which a fast track CHC application was approved to the care package being provided for the financial years 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21?
Provided in the table below is the average wait in days .  Please note that the information requested was not recorded prior to September 2020.

	2018/2019
	2019/2020
	2020/2021

	Not Recorded 
	Not Recorded
	20 days 


7. What arrangements were made by your Health Board in relation to fast track CHC during the Covid Pandemic during the financial years 2020/21?
Fast track referrals continued to be prioritised and taken on trust for follow up reviews by telephone assessments and remote meetings between March 2020 and November 2020. From November 2020 a mixture of remote and face to face follow-up assessments were undertaken depending on the COVID-19 restrictions at the time in Wales, Welsh Government COVID-19 revised hospital discharge guidance, the location risk assessment and the individual risk assessment.

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


