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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 612/21/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 19th April 2022 


Further to your request for information dated 15th March 2022, I am pleased to provide the following response. Please accept our sincere apologies for the delay. 
Your request and our response:
I am researching the incidence and treatment of oesophageal and gastric cancer. I would greatly appreciate if you could answer the following questions.

1. How many patients were treated in the past 3 months for gastric and gastro-oesophageal junction cancer (any stage) with the following:
Provided in the table below are the number of patients treated for gastric and gastro-oesophageal junction cancer (any stage) with the medications listed from 1st December 2021 to 28th February 2022.  
	Treatment
	Number of Patients

	CAPOX (Capecitabine with Oxaliplatin)
	*Not known 

	FOLFOX (Folinic acid, Fluorouracil and Oxaliplatin)
	*Not known 

	Pembrolizumab in combination with Platinum (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin) and Fluoropyrimidine (5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine)
	0

	Any other systemic anti-cancer therapy 
	*Not known

	Palliative care only 
	0


* Unfortunately we are unable to provide this information as it is not recorded on our cancer database. 
2. How many patients were treated in the past 3 months for oesophageal cancer (any stage) with the following:
Provided in the table below are the number of patients treated for oesophageal cancer (any stage) with the medications listed from 1st December 2021 to 28th February 2022.  
	Treatment
	Number of Patients

	Pembrolizumab in combination with Platinum (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin) and Fluoropyrimidine (5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine)
	0

	Platinum and Fluoropyrimidine based combination treatments (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin with 5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine) 
	 Cap Ox (14) Ox Mdg (3) cis cape (6)

	Nivolumab monotherapy
	7

	Nivolumab and Ipilimumab
	0

	Any other systemic anti-cancer therapy 
	*Not known 

	Palliative care only 
	1


* Unfortunately we are unable to provide this information as it is not recorded on our cancer database. 

3. Of the oesophageal cancer patients (from question 2) treated with pembrolizumab in the past 3 months, how many patients were treated for:
	Treatment
	Number of Patients

	Oesophageal adenocarcinoma
	0

	Oesophageal squamous cell carcinoma
	0


4. How many patients were treated in the past 3 months for advanced/metastatic oesophageal cancer only with the following.
Provided in the table below are the number of patients treated for advanced/metastatic oesophageal cancer with the medications listed from 1st December 2021 to 28th February 2022.  
	Treatment
	Number of Patients

	Pembrolizumab in combination with Platinum (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin) and Fluoropyrimidine (5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine)
	0

	Platinum and Fluoropyrimidine based combination treatments (Cisplatin or Oxaliplatin with 5-Fluorouracil or Capecitabine) 
	Cap Ox (6), Cis cape (2)

	Nivolumab monotherapy
	5

	Nivolumab and Ipilimumab
	0

	Any other systemic anti-cancer therapy
	*Not known 

	Palliative care only 
	1 (Metastatic)
0 (Advanced)


* Unfortunately we are unable to provide this information as it is not recorded on our cancer database. 
5. Of the advanced/metastatic oesophageal cancer patients (from question 4) treated in the past 3 months, how many patients were treated for: 
	Treatment
	Number of Patients

	Advanced/metastatic oesophageal adenocarcinoma
	*Not known 

	Advanced/metastatic oesophageal squamous cell carcinoma 
	*Not known 


* Unfortunately we are unable to provide this information as it is not recorded on our cancer database. 

6. Does your Health Board participate in any active clinical trials for the treatment of oesophageal cancer? If so, can you please provide the name of each trial and the number of patients taking part.
	Name of trial
	Number of patients taking part

	SCOPE 2 - Study of chemoradiotherapy in oesophageal cancer including PET response and dose Escalation
	23

	PLATFORM - Planning treatment for oesophago-gastric cancer: a randomised maintenance therapy trial 
	21

	ADD ASPIRIN - Taking daily aspirin after early stage cancer treatment
	57



We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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