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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 522/21/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 11th February 2022 


Further to your request for information dated 20th January 2022, I am pleased to provide the following response. 

Your request and our response:

1. How much funding is Betsi Cadwaladr Health Board (BCUHB) committing towards supporting children and young people with experience of Violence Against Women, Domestic Abuse, Sexual Violence (VAWDASV)? Please supply the following information, disaggregating statutory services from third sector services.  
There is no allocated specific funding within BCUHB children’s services for children and young people with experience of VAWDASV. All children and young people have access to universal services provided by health visiting and school nursing teams, and secondary care services that fall under the remit of children’s services which include acute paediatrics, child psychology, child and adolescent mental health (CAMHS), community paediatrics, learning disabilities and neurodevelopmental services. 

The Amethyst Sexual Assault Referral Centre (SARC) employs two Children and Young People’s Sexual Violence Advisors (CYPSVAs) and one Young Person’s Sexual Violence Advisor (YPSVA), who work with children and young people who have suffered sexual violence. 
In addition to this, BCUHB employ the SARC Manager and one in hour’s crisis worker, with ten out of hours crisis workers. Part of their role is to support children and young people who have suffered sexual violence. 
2. The annual budget and spending on support for children and young people affected by VAWDASV for the last 3 financial years?
There is no allocated specific funding within BCUHB children’s services for children and young people with experience of VAWDASV. Core services and budget allocation is across the service. 

Within the SARC, the annual budget is as follows:
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3. The names of the services who are commissioned during the last 3 financial years and what specific support they are commissioned to provide for children and young people affected by VAWDASV? (As defined within the Welsh Government Statutory Commissioning Guidance). 
There have been no specific services commissioned over the last 3 years around specific support for Children and Young People (CYP) affected by VAWDASV. 

Within children’s services, private providers have been commissioned for CYP requiring neurodevelopment assessment and assessment and intervention services for CAMHS.  However, they have not been commissioned to provide specific support for CYP affected by VAWDASV.
Amethyst SARC, provide two CYPSVAs and one YPSVA. These workers support children and young people who have suffered sexual violence. The service is commissioned to provide an in and out of hours service:
1)
Health wellbeing and safety needs assessment on each child 

2)
Holistic support on an individual needs basis including pre-trial visits, return to    

            education and emotional and practical support

3)
Delivery of a sexual health clinic for children under the age of 13

4)
Delivery of a sexual health clinic for young people aged 13-18

5)
Delivery of an acute forensic service
4. The length of contracts for the above commissioned services.   

Contracts have been in place for 2 years for services commissioned within children’s services, but these have been extended. 

CYPSVAs and YPSVA have one year short-term contracts, although the current CYPSVAs are in substantive Health board contracts due to length of employment. 

The consultant paediatricians supporting the Amethyst SARC are substantive posts, within BCUHB. SARC Manager and crisis workers are substantive posts within BCUHB.
  

5. What data does BCUHB hold on the number and percentage of children affected by VAWDASV who are supported by their commissioned services? Please supply the following data, disaggregated across protected characteristics as defined by the Equality Act 2010. If it is not possible to provide the disaggregated data, please explain why and provide the aggregated data. 
6. The number of children affected by VAWDASV supported by each commissioned service during each of the last 3 financial years. 

In response to questions 5 and 6, within children’s services, private providers have been commissioned for children and young people requiring neurodevelopment assessment and assessment and intervention services for CAMHS.  However, they have not been commissioned to provide specific support for CYP affected by VAWDASV. Over the last 3 years, 2000 children and young people have been referred to the private providers. BCUHB do not hold data on the numbers of these children that have been affected by VAWDASV 
BCUHB do not hold specific data around core services that have been accessed by children affected by VAWDASV.

Provided in the table below are the number of children and young people accessing the SARC who have experienced sexual violence.

	1st April 2019 – 31st March 2020
	158

	1st April 2020 – 31st March 2021
	109

	1st April 2021 – 31st December 2021
	115


The table below highlights the number of Child at Risk reports received whereby the child has been recorded as being exposed to Adverse Childhood Experience: Domestic Violence. The data is from May 2019 until 26th January 2022 broken down by area.

	VAWDASV
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	Total

	West
(Gwynedd & Anglesey)
	69
	105
	128
	13
	315

	Central
(Conwy & Denbighshire)
	138
	252
	305
	31
	726

	East
(Wrexham & Flintshire)
	80
	301
	279
	14
	674

	Out of Area
	1
	5
	0
	0
	6

	Total
	288
	663
	712
	58
	1721


7. The percentage of children affected by VAWDASV supported by each commissioned service during each of the last 3 financial years. 
Unfortunately we are unable to respond to this question as BCUHB does not record this information. 
8. How is BCUHB aligning their commissioning of social care and support for children and young people with commissioning of specialist VAWDASV support? 
From the point of view from the Amethyst SARC, we continue to collaborate with our colleagues in safeguarding and other services in influencing and driving forward comprehensive services for children and young people who are victims of VAWDASV.
9. How does strategic decision making around ACEs link up with strategic decision making about VAWDASV within Local Authority committees? 
Unfortunately we are unable to respond to this question as BCUHB does not record this information. 

10. When did the Local Authority Children and Young People’s Scrutiny Committee last scrutinise the provision of services and support to child VAWDASV victims? What were the findings, and how do the findings fulfil the duties on public bodies under the VAWDASV (Wales) Act 2015? 
Unfortunately we are unable to respond to this question as BCUHB does not record this information. 

  

11. What is included about VAWDASV and its impact on children and young people in the local assessment of wellbeing as required under the Wellbeing of Future Generations Act?  
The Well-being of Future Generations (Wales) Act aims to improve the social, economic, environmental and cultural well-being of Wales and it introduces seven well-being goals, which are relevant to prevention of violence against women, domestic abuse and sexual violence and support survivors:
· A globally responsible Wales

· A prosperous Wales

· A resilient Wales

· A healthier Wales

· A more equal Wales

· A wales of Cohesive Communities

· A Wales of vibrant culture and thriving Welsh Language

The North Wales VAWDASV Strategy 2018-2023 is underpinned by the seven well-being goals in the Act. This includes prevention, protection and support.  BCUHB works closely with partner agencies and monitor and report activities against the objectives. BCUHB activities include partnership working, delivering mandatory VAWDASV training to all staff, attending strategic and operational VAWDASV meetings both local, regional and nationally, development of procedures/protocol to support staff, development of projects such as the IRIS project and the Health Independent Domestic Violence Advocates.

12. How were the needs of children and young people affected by VAWDASV included in the aforementioned local assessment of wellbeing?  
Key findings highlighted in the Strategy included:

· Postcode lottery services.  BCUHB serves the population across North Wales and 
aims to provide services that are accessible and equitable.

· An increased focus on intervention rather than prevention.  Those health staff 
working with children and young people are training to recognised the impact of VAWDASV on children. Liaison and early intervention takes place with partner agencies to minimise the risk of children and young people presenting in crisis. The IRIS and IDVA project will support this.

· Safeguarding.  BCUHB have improved there recording of children and young people 
affected by VAWDASV. In May 2019, a system was developed to receive all copies of Child at Risk reports. This gives the safeguarding data analysts an opportunity to monitor the data on a monthly basis.
13. Has the Public Service Board consulted with adult and child victims of VAWDASV in preparation for the local wellbeing plan? If not, are there plans to do so?  
The Local Health Board is a statutory member of the Pubic Services Board. Well-being assessments are published on an annual well-being plan but it is unclear if adults and child victims of VAWDASV were consulted in preparation for the plan.

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


