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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 472/21/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 24th January 2022 



Further to your request for information dated 21st December 2021, I am pleased to provide the following response. 

Your request and our response:
On the 22nd December 2021, the Health Board further clarified that responses to Questions 1 and 2, the COVID-19 data held only goes as far back to 1st March 2020.  Therefore information from this date to 31st December 2021 has been provided.

1. The monthly hospital totals of patients who have died from (not 'with') COVID-19 since January 2019? 
a) From each total, how many patients were unvaccinated?

2. The monthly hospital admission totals for patients who were admitted solely for COVID-19 since January 2019? (Not for another health reason, despite a positive test result).  

a) From each total, how many patients were unvaccinated?

From 1st March 2020 (when the first death was recorded due to COVID-19), up until 31st December 2021, 87 people died within our three main acute hospital sites; Ysbyty Gwynedd, Ysbyty Glan Clwyd and Wrexham Maelor Hospital, where COVID-19 was given as the only cause of death i.e. no contributing factors.  
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter also acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Health Board can confirm that the cause of death occurring in our community hospitals is not recorded electronically. In order to gather this information we would have to carry out a specific exercise of reviewing the Medical Certificate Cause of Death (MCCD) books for each community hospital to establish whether COVID-19 was the sole cause of death i.e. with no contributing factors. We have established that to comply with your request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This is currently £450. In reaching this decision, we estimate that it would take staff approximately 62 hours to review the information. This figure is based on a timescale of 5 minutes per patient death, there being 846 deaths between 1st March 2020 which is the date of the first death within our acute setting and 30th December 2021. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 71 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £1,775  

As you will be aware this is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.
Under our obligation to advise and assist, we have provided website links to the Office of National Statistics (ONS) and Public Health Wales (PHW) where you will be able to access further information on the cause of death by location.

https://www.ons.gov.uk/peoplepopulationandcommunity/birthsdeathsandmarriages/deaths/bulletins/deathsinvolvingcovid19bylocalareasanddeprivation/deathsoccurringbetween1marchand31july2020#local-authorities 
https://phw.nhs.wales/topics/latest-information-on-novel-coronavirus-covid-19/
For future reference, please also see the following link to our disclosure log in which we have a section specifically for COVID-19 requests: 

https://bcuhb.nhs.wales/about-us/requests-for-information/foi-disclosure-log-2020-21/covid-19-foi-requests/
Important notes on this Freedom of Information response.
 
It is important to note that the number of people with COVID-19 as the only entry on their death certificates is small, and does not represent the number of people whose cause of death is as a direct consequence of COVID-19, which is significantly higher. 
3. The monthly hospital admission totals for patients who were admitted for flu since January 2019? 
4. The monthly hospital admission totals for patients who were admitted for pneumonia since January 2019?
5. The monthly hospital admission totals for patients who were admitted for cardiac issues since January 2019?
6. The monthly hospital admission totals for patients who were admitted for blood clots since January 2019? 
Please refer to the embedded spreadsheet below for our responses in relation to the information requested. 
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7. The monthly figures of deaths and adverse side-effects from the COVID-19 vaccinations.

BCUHB does not record this information and we are therefore unable to respond to this part of your request.
8. The monthly figures of all patient deaths occurring within 28 days of a Covid-19 vaccination? 
Please refer to our response to question 3 above. 
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Data

		1st January 2019 to 31st October 2021

		3) The monthly hospital admission totals for patients who were admitted for flu since Jan 2019.

				2019																								2020										2021

		Area		Jan		Feb		Mar		Apr		May		Jun		Jul		Aug		Sep		Oct		Nov		Dec		Jan		Feb		Mar		Apr		Jun		Jan		May		Jun		Jul		Aug		Sep		Oct		Total

		West		33		23		30		12		3		1		0		0		1		1		3		46		19		7		2		1		0		0		0		3		0		0		2		2		189

		Cent		51		34		8		6		2		1		0		0		0		0		5		75		28		1		4		0		0		1		0		0		0		1		1		2		220

		East		35		34		13		4		2		3		1		1		0		0		8		65		4		2		1		0		1		0		1		0		1		0		1		2		179

		Grand Total		119		91		51		22		7		5		1		1		1		1		16		186		51		10		7		1		1		1		1		3		1		1		4		6		588

		4) The monthly hospital admission totals for patients who were admitted for pneumonia since Jan 2019.

				2019																								2020																								2021

		Area		Jan		Feb		Mar		Apr		May		Jun		Jul		Aug		Sep		Oct		Nov		Dec		Jan		Feb		Mar		Apr		May		Jun		Jul		Aug		Sep		Oct		Nov		Dec		Jan		Feb		Mar		Apr		May		Jun		Jul		Aug		Sep		Oct		Total

		West		206		171		217		184		176		144		156		153		148		158		182		233		225		196		167		119		113		110		104		113		129		140		118		133		193		150		120		109		100		113		135		137		146		175		5173

		Cent		154		140		166		174		126		151		133		129		131		163		187		267		210		156		175		186		166		133		89		135		109		143		153		176		219		143		146		138		144		130		180		162		160		175		5349

		East		224		165		151		205		146		138		127		144		139		162		174		213		185		183		139		135		133		117		153		102		105		168		132		190		344		160		117		115		108		114		143		124		118		148		5221

		Grand Total		584		476		534		563		448		433		416		426		418		483		543		713		620		535		481		440		412		360		346		350		343		451		403		499		756		453		383		362		352		357		458		423		424		498		15743

		5) The monthly hospital admission totals for patients who were admitted for cardiac issues since Jan 2019.

				2019																								2020																								2021

		Area		Jan		Feb		Mar		Apr		May		Jun		Jul		Aug		Sep		Oct		Nov		Dec		Jan		Feb		Mar		Apr		May		Jun		Jul		Aug		Sep		Oct		Nov		Dec		Jan		Feb		Mar		Apr		May		Jun		Jul		Aug		Sep		Oct		Total

		West		1803		1652		1750		1732		1709		1571		1747		1565		1547		1636		1544		1587		1601		1602		1363		783		968		1149		1279		1368		1444		1528		1416		1482		1545		1229		1269		1318		1395		1460		1526		1442		1400		1422		49832

		Cent		1747		1611		1769		1675		1730		1693		1760		1651		1690		1819		1784		1660		1918		1716		1506		975		1232		1211		1408		1410		1417		1529		1480		1544		1308		1289		1566		1589		1536		1528		1564		1405		1351		1394		52465

		East		1421		1294		1408		1342		1368		1214		1413		1137		1222		1394		1349		1263		1346		1224		1057		638		895		878		870		804		905		949		862		903		845		820		969		1002		1062		1130		1064		1012		942		962		36964

		Grand Total		4971		4557		4927		4749		4807		4478		4920		4353		4459		4849		4677		4510		4865		4542		3926		2396		3095		3238		3557		3582		3766		4006		3758		3929		3698		3338		3804		3909		3993		4118		4154		3859		3693		3778		139261

		6) The monthly hospital admission totals for patients who were admitted for blood clots since Jan 2019.

				2019																								2020																								2021

		Area		Jan		Feb		Mar		Apr		May		Jun		Jul		Aug		Sep		Oct		Nov		Dec		Jan		Feb		Mar		Apr		May		Jun		Jul		Aug		Sep		Oct		Nov		Dec		Jan		Feb		Mar		Apr		May		Jun		Jul		Aug		Sep		Oct		Grand Total

		West		47		35		33		35		22		21		29		26		24		23		26		36		18		21		21		18		25		31		28		25		20		45		26		40		39		22		28		22		33		20		32		24		26		33		954

		Cent		26		28		29		29		39		26		32		45		17		28		28		35		38		29		44		29		41		34		35		42		42		51		41		43		62		46		49		40		33		36		48		50		36		40		1271

		East		25		24		29		20		20		26		32		22		24		29		34		13		21		30		22		15		9		16		28		16		19		14		18		27		34		33		36		30		24		28		19		22		25		23		807

		Grand Total		98		87		91		84		81		73		93		93		65		80		88		84		77		80		87		62		75		81		91		83		81		110		85		110		135		101		113		92		90		84		99		96		87		96		3032

		8) The monthly figures of all patient deaths occurring within 28 days of a Covid-19/Coronavirus vaccination.

		DaysDiff		Count				Patients discharged from hospital with a Discharge Method of Patient Died (4) & within 28 days of their latest Covid-19 vaccination date (join based on NHS Number)

		1		6

		2		4

		3		9

		4		7

		5		12

		6		15				The table (left) is just hospital deaths as we are unable to give community deaths.

		7		8

		8		16

		9		10

		10		17

		11		10

		12		21

		13		14

		14		22

		15		17

		16		18

		17		8

		18		12

		19		17

		20		19

		21		18

		22		24

		23		19

		24		18

		25		13

		26		21

		27		20

		28		21

		Grand Total		416



&LData Source: Data Warehouse &D&C
&R&F Information Department




