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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 341/20/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 29th November 2021 


Further to your request for information dated 21st October 2021, I am pleased to provide the following response. Please accept our apologies for the delay. 
Your request and our response:
Please provide the following information: 
You further clarified that by vaccine you are referring to the COVID-19 vaccine. 
For the year 2020:
1. I would like to know how many people have died in your hospital(s) with COVID-19?
	Measure
	Date Range
	Total

	Deaths within 28 days of a positive Covid-19 test
	1st January– 31st December 2020
	592


For future reference, please also see the following link to our disclosure log in which we have a section specifically for Covid-19 requests: 

https://bcuhb.nhs.wales/about-us/requests-for-information/foi-disclosure-log-2020-21/covid-19-foi-requests/
2. Of those people that died with COVID-19, how many of them died only due to COVID-19? Not deaths within 28 days of a positive COVID-19 test, as they could have died from other causes.  I just want to know the exact figures for deaths due to COVID-19 alone?  In other words without any underlying or pre-existing health conditions?
From 1st March 2020 (when the first death was recorded due to COVID-19), up until 31st December 2020, 26 people died within our three main acute hospital sites where COVID-19 was given as the only cause of death i.e. no contributing factors.  

In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter also acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Health Board can confirm that the cause of death occurring in our community hospitals is not recorded electronically. In order to gather this information we would have to carry out a specific exercise of reviewing the Medical Certificate Cause of Death (MCCD) books for each community hospital to establish whether COVID-19 was the sole cause of death i.e. with no contributing factors. We have established that to comply with your request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff approximately 35 hours to review the information. This figure is based on a timescale of 5 minutes per patient death, there being 414 deaths between 1st March 2020 which is the date of the first death within BCUHB and 30th December 2020 in our community hospitals. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 35 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £875. As you will be aware this is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.
3. Of the total number of people that have died with COVID-19 please could you let me know how many of those were unvaccinated, how many had received 1 dose of the vaccine and how many had received 2 doses of the vaccine?
4. Of the number of people that died of COVID-19 alone, please could you let me know how many of those were unvaccinated, how many had received 1 dose of the vaccine and how many had received 2 doses of the vaccine?
Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board did not commence its vaccination drive until the 8th December 2020 and of the 592 deaths referred to in our response to question 1 who died 28 days after testing positive for covid-19, no patients had been vaccinated.
5. Please advise the number of children aged 12-19 that died with COVID-19?
There were not any children aged between 12 and 19 that died within 28 days of a positive COVID-19 test during 2020.

6. Of those children that died with COVID-19 please advise the exact number of children that died of COVID-19 alone (in other words with no pre-existing or underlying health problems)?
Not Applicable, please see our response to question 5 above.

7. Please advise how many admissions you have had relating to:-

a) myocarditis 

b) blood clots

c) strokes

d) Bell's Palsy

8. Of the people admitted as per question 7 above, please advise how many were unvaccinated, how many had received 1 dose of the vaccine and how many had received 2 doses of the vaccine?
	1st January 2020 to 31st December 2020
	Doses
	Total Admissions

	Measure | Admissions with a diagnosis of: 
	0
	1
	2
	 

	a) Myocarditis
	2
	0
	12
	14

	b) Blood clots
	96
	4
	147
	247

	c) Stroke
	393
	36
	674
	1103

	d) Bell's Palsy
	59
	5
	116
	180


9. Of the people admitted relating to myocarditis, how many of these were within the age group 15-20?
During 2020, there were not any patients aged between 15 and 20 with a diagnosis of myocarditis admitted to a hospital.

For the year 2021 (to date): 
1. I would like to know how many people have died in your hospital(s) with COVID-19?

	Measure
	Date Range
	Total

	Deaths within 28 days of a positive Covid-19 test
	1st January – 30th September 2021
	470


2. Of those people that died with COVID-19, how many of them died only due to COVID-19?  Not deaths within 28 days of a positive covid test, as they could have died from other causes.  I just want to know the exact figures for deaths due to COVID-19 alone?  In other words without any underlying or pre-existing health conditions?

From 1st January up until 30th September 2021, 44 people died within our three main acute hospital sites where COVID-19 was given as the only cause of death i.e. no contributing factors.  
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter also acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Health Board can confirm that the cause of death occurring in our community hospitals is not recorded electronically. In order to gather this information we would have to carry out a specific exercise of reviewing the Medical Certificate Cause of Death (MCCD) books for each community hospital to establish whether COVID-19 was the sole cause of death i.e. with no contributing factors. We would also have to carry out a specific exercise to establish the vaccination status of these deaths along with the 44 patients who died within an acute site. We have established that to comply with your request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff approximately 68 hours to review the information. This figure is based on a timescale of 10 minutes per patient death, there being 367 deaths between 1st January 2020 and 30th September 2020 within in our community hospitals and the additional 44 patients within our acute to establish their vaccination staus. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 68 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £1,700. As you will be aware this is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.
3. Of the total number of people that have died with COVID-19 please could you let me know how many of those were unvaccinated, how many had received 1 dose of the vaccine and how many had received 2 doses of the vaccine?
	1st January 2021 - 30th September 2021
	Doses

	Measure
	0
	1
	2

	Deaths within 28 days of a positive Covid-19 test
	272
	74
	124


4. Of the number of people that died of COVID-19 alone, please could you let me know how many of those were unvaccinated, how many had received 1 dose of the vaccine and how many had received 2 doses of the vaccine?
Please refer to question 2 above and the cost limit applied as this is not information that the Health Board routinely records to this level of detail.
5. Please advise the number of children aged 12-19 that died with COVID-19?
There were not any children aged between 12 and 19 that died within 28 days of a positive COVID-19 test during 2021 (up until 30th September).
6. Of those children that died with COVID-19 please advise the number of children that died of COVID-19 alone (with no pre-existing or underlying health problems)?

Not Applicable, please see our response to question 5 above.
7. Please advise how many admissions you have had relating to:-

a) myocarditis 

b) blood clots

c) strokes

d) Bell's Palsy

8. Of the people admitted as per question 7 above, please advise how many were unvaccinated, how many had received 1 dose of the vaccine and how many had received 2 doses of the vaccine?
	1st January 2021 - 31st August 2021 (latest data available)
	Doses
	Total Admissions

	Measure | Admissions with a diagnosis of: 
	0
	1
	2
	 

	a) Myocarditis
	5
	0
	2
	7

	b) Blood clots
	17
	13
	132
	162

	c) Stroke
	107
	57
	661
	825

	d) Bell's Palsy
	10
	10
	63
	83


9. Of the people admitted relating to myocarditis, how many of these have been within the age group 15-20? And how many of these are unvaccinated and how many are vaccinated?
During 2021 (up until 31st August 2021 which is the latest date available), there were not any patients aged between 15 and 20 with a diagnosis of myocarditis admitted to a hospital.


We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


