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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 227/21/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 28th September 2021 


Further to your request for information dated 19th August 2021, I am pleased to provide the following response. Please accept our sincere apologies for the delay. 
Your request and our response:

I have a freedom of information request related to the treatment of certain blood disorders. I would greatly appreciate if you could answer the following questions. 
1. How many patients has your trust treated (for any disease) in the last 6 months with the following treatments: 
Provided in the table below are the number of patients treated in secondary care with each of the medications listed. Due to the way in which we record information in primary care, we can only provide the number of prescription items issued, therefore please note that it is possible that the same patients may have received treatment from primary and secondary care in the same 12 month period.
	Treatment 
	Number of prescription items issued by a community pharmacy (1/12/20 – 31/5/21)
	Number of patients issued treatment in secondary care (23/2/21 – 23/8/21)

	Doptelet (avatrombopag)  
	0
	0

	Jakavi (ruxolitinib)
	0
	27

	Nplate (romiplostim) 
	0
	8

	Revolade (eltrombopag)  
	12
	32

	Tavlesse (fostamatinib) 
	0
	0

	Hydroxycarbamide
	0
	217


2. In the last 6 months, how many patients has your trust treated for:
· Immune thrombocytopenia (ICD10 code D69.3)

· Myelofibrosis (ICD10 code D47.4)

· Myelofibrosis (ICD10 code D47.4) patients over the age 65
Provided in the table below are the number of patients discharged for each of the conditions listed from 1st January 2021 to 30th June 2021. 

	Condition
	Number of patients discharged with the condition 

	Immune thrombocytopenia (ICD10 code D69.3)
	93

	Myelofibrosis (ICD10 code D47.4)
	124

	Myelofibrosis (ICD10 code D47.4) patients over the age 65 
	61


3. Of the patients treated for immune thrombocytopenia (ICD10 code D69.3) in the last 6 months, how many were treated with: 
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Health Board does not hold the data in a format that would enable us to fully respond to your request to the level of detail required.  
As this is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to collate this data. From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 23 hours to locate and review all of the notes for patients discharged with immune thrombocytopenia in the last 6 months. This figure is based on a timescale of 15 minutes per record, there being 93 records to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 23@ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £575
However under our duty to advise and assist we are able to confirm the total number of times the treatments specified in your request has been issued for any condition.
	
	Number of prescription items of named drug dispensed by a community pharmacy (1/12/20 – 31/5/21)
	Number of patients issued supply of named drug in secondary care (23/2/21 – 23/8/21)

	· Mycophenoalte mofetil  
	1049
	416

	· Rituximab
	0
	156


4. How many myelofibrosis (ICD10 code D47.4) patients has your trust diagnosed in the past 3 years? 

· Of the myelofibrosis patients diagnosed in the last 3 years, how many were treated in the past 6 months with Hydroxycarbamide? 

· Of the myelofibrosis patients diagnosed in the last 3 years, how many have received no active treatment in the past 6 months?
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Health Board does not hold the data in a format that would enable us to fully respond to your request to the level of detail required.  

As this is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to collate this data. From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 31 hours to locate and review all of the notes for patients discharged with myelofibrosis in the last 6 months. This figure is based on a timescale of 15 minutes per record, there being 124 records to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 31@ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £775
However under our duty to advise and assist we are able to confirm the total number of times the treatments specified in your request has been issued for any condition.
5. Does you trust participate in any ongoing clinical trials for immune thrombocytopenia (ITP)? If so, can you please provide the name of each trial along with the number of patients taking part? 

Yes, UK Adult Idiopathic Thrombocytopenic Purpura (ITP) Registry: An Investigation of Disease Progression, Treatment Effectiveness, and Co-morbid Conditions with 56 patients taking part across BCUHB.  
6. Does you trust participate in any ongoing clinical trials for myelofibrosis? If so, can you please provide the name of each trial along with the number of patients taking part? 

BCUHB is not currently participating in any clinical trials for myelofibrosis. 

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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