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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 146/21/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 19th July 2021 


Further to your request for information dated 30th June 2021, I am pleased to provide the following response. 
Your request:
Please provide me with the dataset held by Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) in relation to hearings convened under the Section 23 discharge power contained in the Mental Health Act 1983 (s.23 MHA 1983). These hearings are generally referred to as Hospital Managers’ Hearings, Associate Hospital Managers’ Hearings or Hospital Managers’ Panels. 
A similar request to that outlined below was made in 2018/2019, and in most cases produced data up to the year 2017/2018. This is a request for updated statistical information to be released taking in the years 2018/2019, 2019/2020, and 2020/2021 (running April to March for each year).  
If data is held at both a hospital level and the same data is also centrally aggregated within the Health Board, then I would only like access to the central dataset.  
Information included in such a dataset(s) might include, but may not be limited to:
1. Number of hearings scheduled, which may include a breakdown by type of hearing (e.g. divided by type of section (section 2, 3 etc.), and / or type of hearing (e.g. s.20 renewal, s.25 barring order).

2. Number of discharges, perhaps broken down by type of section / hearing.

3. Number of times a hearing request was refused because of the proximity of a Mental Health Tribunal hearing (38.13 MHA 1983 Code of Practice, 2015)

4. Number of hearings cancelled before the hearing took place, with reasons (e.g. responsible Clinician discharged patient, Tribunal discharged patient)

5. Number of hearings held, perhaps broken down by type of section / hearing (e.g. paper hearing).

6. Number of adjournments, perhaps broken down by type of section / hearing.

7. Attendees at the hearing.  For example, the number of times a patient attended, or was accompanied by their legal represented, or their nearest relative.

I would prefer the information to be supplied in an electronic, re-usable format.

Please also confirm that any datasets provided in response to this request are made available under an Open Government License v3.0, and can be used in relation to research publications.
Our Response: 
Please refer to the embedded document below for our responses in relation to questions 1 to 6. 
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Also, and in accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Health Board does not hold the data in a format that would enable us to fully respond to your request to the level of detail required for question 7.  The only way we could identify the attendees at each hearing would be to review the decision form for each hearing that has taken place during the time period in question.
As this is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to collate this data. From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 79 hours to locate and review the decision form for each of the 319 hearings that have taken place between 2018 and the present day, as per our response for question 4. This figure is based on a timescale of 15 minutes per decision form. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 79 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £1,975. 

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg
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146/21/FOI - Hearing convened under s23 discharge power (Hospital Managers’ Hearings)

Question

Year 2018/2019
(April 18/March 19)

2019/2020
(April 2019/March 2020)

Year 2020/21
(April 2020/ March 2021)

Number of Hearings Scheduled 193 181 920
5 Barrings 3 Barrings
Breakdown by Type 4 Discretionary Reviews 4 Discretionary Reviews 14 Patient appeals
157 Renewals 155 Renewals 76 Renewals
27 Applications by the patient | 19 Applications by the patient
1 4xS2 1xS2
118 x S3 2x8S2
Breakdown by Sections (S 2xS37 éﬂsxgs 65x 53
reakdown by Sections (S) 5% S47 3 i > 18 x CTO
64 x Community Treatment 47 x CTO 5 x S47
Order (CTO)
Number of discharges 6 2 0
3 x Renewals
Breakdown by type 2 x Patient Appeals 2 x Renewal N/A
2 1 x Discretionary Review
1xS2
] 1xS3
Breakdown by Section 2xCTO N/A
1xCTO
3xS3
Number of times a hearing request was refused because of the proximity of a Mental Health
Review Tribunal (MHRT) For all years
In April 2020 Welsh Government issued guidance
due to Coronavirus. Throughout the Covid 19
pandemic hearings were arranged in line with the
same guidance given for Mental Health Review
Tribunals. Guidance was also issued by Welsh
3 There is no evidence of a hearing being refused because of an impending MHRT, although hearings | Government in relation to Hospital Managers’
have been cancelled following discharge from the MHRT. General practice is not to refuse asitis a | discharge powers under the Mental Health Act.
patients right to apply to both the MHRT and Managers Hearing if they so wish. It is a requirement Taking into account that the patients right to
of the MHA for a Managers Hearing to be held on a renewal. liberty as set out in Article 5(4) is protected by the
MHRT for Wales and not Hospital Managers.
Guidance followed was:
« If a patient requests a hearing under a S2
appeal it should be suggested that he / she makes
an application to the MHRT for Wales.






* During the current Covid 19 crisis, it is
suggested that a panel should not sit if the MHRT
for Wales has considered the patients case in the
last six weeks or is due to do so in the next eight
weeks.

» Hearings should take place as soon as it is
practicable for the hearing to be arranged.

* The impact of the pandemic will need to be
taken into account if it is likely that, for the
foreseeable future, some hearings will need to be
adjourned or to take place remotely.

In reference to the final bullet point above, the
Health Board has ensured that patients who had
capacity to indicate that they did not object to their
section being renewed were to be arranged at a
later date, patients who were objecting or did not
have capacity to do so had a hearing arranged as
per standard practice, this has been in place since
the end of March 2020.

Please find below a link to the Welsh Government
guidance: https://gov.wales/mental-health-
guidance-hospital-managers-covid-19-
html#section-40813

Number of hearings cancelled
before the hearing took place

58

51

36

Reasons for cancellations

16 x Discharged by
Responsible Clinician (RC)
2 x CTOs were revoked

1 x Discharged by MHRT
1 x Regraded to S37/41
14 x Regraded to informal
3 x Transferred to another
hospital

5 x Reason not recorded

5 x Reason not recorded

11 x Postponed (reasons,
conflict of interest, sickness,
patient absent without leave)
18 x Discharged by RC

1 x Invalid detention

1 x Patient deceased

7 x Regraded to informal

1 x Transferred to another
hospital

1 x Section lapsed

5 x Postponed due to Covid 19
1 x CTO revoked

9 x Discharged by RC

1 x Discharged by MHRT

7 x Patients regraded to informal
1 x Patient regraded to a CTO
2 x Patients withdrew

2 x Patients deceased

1 x due to room availability

5 x not noted

2 x Postponed — other reasons




https://gov.wales/mental-health-guidance-hospital-managers-covid-19-html#section-40813

https://gov.wales/mental-health-guidance-hospital-managers-covid-19-html#section-40813

https://gov.wales/mental-health-guidance-hospital-managers-covid-19-html#section-40813



9 x Postponed (reasons
include professional
attendance due to sickness).
7 X patients withdrew

5 x Patients withdrew
1 x discharged by the MHRT

Number of hearings held

(These have been via face to face | 135 130 54
and Virtual Conferencing (VC), no
paper reviews are held).

2 Barring 2 Barring

Breakdown by Type

4 Discretionary Review
117 Renewals
12 Patient appeals

3 Discretionary Reviews
116 Renewals
9 Patient appeals

4 x Patient appeals
50 x Renewals

2x 82 1xS2
79 x S3 90 x S3 37 x S3
Breakdown by Sections 2 x S37 3 x S37 14 x CTO
4 x S47 3 x S47 3 x S47
48 X CTO 33xCTO
Number of adjournments 10 4 3
1 x Barring

Breakdown by type

1 x Discretionary Review

2 x Patient applications

3 x renewals

2 x Renewal
8 x Renewals
Breakdown by section 7xS3 3xS3 2xS3
3xCTO 1xCTO 1xCTO

Attendees at the hearing

It is not possible to answer this
guestion as the information is only
contained within the decision form
which is part of the patient’s clinical
notes, it is not captured within any
databases.

It is recorded that 51 patients
have legal representatives
involved but it is not clear if
they attended without
viewing the actual decision
forms.

It is recorded that 41 patients
have legal representatives
involved but it is not clear if
they attended without
viewing the actual decision
forms.

It is recorded that 27 patients have legal
representatives involved but it is not clear if they
attended without viewing the actual decision
forms.







