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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 095/21/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 6th July 2021 


Further to your request for information dated 7th June 2021, I am pleased to provide the following response. 

Your request and our response: 

1. In the past 3 months, how many Urothelial cancer patients were treated with the following:
Provided in the table below are the number of patients that have been dispensed the below treatments between 1st March 2021 and 31st May 2021. 
Please note, our system does not hold data on indication, therefore the figures provided below are for the total numbers of patients which may include the listed indication (urothelial) in addition to other indications. Where figures for “treatment A monotherapy” has been requested, these figures exclude use of treatment A with any of the other listed treatments, but may include patients treated with treatment A in addition to other, non-listed, therapies.

	Treatment 
	Total 

	Atezolizumab  
	4

	Carboplatin with Gemcitabine 
	6

	Carboplatin single or in any other combination  
	*176 

	Cisplatin with Gemcitabine 
	1

	Cisplatin single or in any other combination 
	*45 

	Nivolumab  
	0

	Pembrolizumab   
	0

	Any other regimen including Paclitaxel 
	*26 

	Any other chemotherapy regimen 
	0

	Other active systemic anti-cancer therapy [please state] 
	0

	Palliative care only 
	0


* Please note that this is not condition specific data but the total number dispensed within the specified timeframe. 
2. Does Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) participate in any ongoing clinical trials for the treatment of urothelial cancer? If so, can you please provide the name of each trial along with the number of patients taking part? 
BCUHB are not currently participating in any ongoing clinical trials for the treatment of urothelial cancer. 
3. In the past 3 months, how many non-small cell lung cancer (NSCLC) patients were treated with:
Provided in the table below are the number of patients that have been dispensed the below treatments between 1st March 2021 and 31st May 2021. 
Please note, our system does not hold data on indication, therefore the figures provided below are for the total numbers of patients which may include the listed indication (NSCLC) in addition to other indications. Where figures for “treatment A monotherapy” has been requested, these figures exclude use of treatment A with any of the other listed treatments, but may include patients treated with treatment A in addition to other, non-listed, therapies.

	Treatment 
	Total  

	Afatinib
	4

	Alectinib 
	3

	Atezolizumab monotherapy
	14

	Atezolizumab + Bevacizumab + Carboplatin + Paclitaxel
	0

	Bevacizumab
	3

	Brigatinib
	0

	Ceritinib 
	0

	Crizotinib
	2

	Dacomitinib 
	3

	Dabrafenib with Trametinib
	0

	Docetaxel
	0

	Durvalumab 
	2

	Erlotinib 
	4

	Gefitinib 
	2

	Gemcitabine 
	0

	Nintedanib with Docetaxel
	1

	Nivolumab
	2

	Osimertinib
	12

	Paclitaxel 
	0

	Pembrolizumab monotherapy
	19

	Pembrolizumab chemo in combination
	14

	Pemetrexed with Carboplatin
	4

	Pemetrexed with Cisplatin
	2

	Vinorelbine and cisplatin/carboplatin
	4

	Any other active systemic anti-cancer therapy
	0

	Palliative care only
	0


4. Does BCUHB participate in any ongoing clinical trials for the treatment of non-small cell lung cancer (NSCLC)? If so, can you please provide the name of each trial along with the number of patients taking part? 
BCUHB are not currently participating in any ongoing clinical trials for the treatment of NSCLC. 

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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