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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 042/21/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 3rd June 2021



Further to your request for information dated 7th May 2021, I am pleased to provide the following response. 

Your request and our response:
1. Could you please provide the numbers of patients treated in the last 3 months by the Dermatology department (for any medical condition) with the following biologic drugs.
Provided in the table below are the total number of patients who were treated with the drugs listed in the three month period from 10th February 2021 to 10th May 2021.
	Treatment
	Number of Patients

	Adalimumab - Humira
	8

	Adalimumab Biosimilar
	130

	Apremilast
	8

	Brodalumab
	1

	Certolizumab
	3

	Dimethyl Fumarate
	12

	Etanercept - Enbrel
	1

	Etanercept Biosimilar
	16

	Guselkumab
	24

	Infliximab - Remicade
	0

	Infliximab Biosimilar
	5

	Ixekizumab
	10

	Risankizumab
	1

	Secukinumab
	27

	Tildrakizumab
	23

	Ustekinumab
	92


2. For the patients treated by the Dermatology department in the last three months with any of the above drugs, can you please provide the total number of paediatric (up to age 16) versus adult patients?

In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Health Board does not hold the data in a format that would enable us to fully respond to your request to the level of detail required as our pharmacy systems do not hold this data.  The only way we could identify how many of the 361 patients identified in question 1 above who received one of the listed treatments were up to 16 years of age would be to review the case notes of the patients. From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450.  In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 60 hours to locate and review patient case notes to determine the age of the patient. This figure is based on a timescale of 10 minutes per record, there being 361 records to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 60 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £1,500.
3. Could you please provide the numbers of patients treated in the last 3 months by the Gastroenterology department (for any medical condition) with the following biologic drugs:
	Treatment
	Number of Prescriptions

	Adalimumab - Humira
	2

	Adalimumab Biosimilar
	146

	Golimumab
	0

	Infliximab - Remicade
	1

	Infliximab Biosimilar
	169

	Tofacitinib
	3

	Ustekinumab
	42

	Vedolizumab
	43





 


 












We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


