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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 038/21/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 16th June 2021


Further to your request for information dated 6th May 2021, I am pleased to provide the following response. Please accept our sincere apologies for the delay.
Your request and our response:
I work for an organisation which supports NHS organisations in the assessment of innovations which arise from the clinical work of NHS professionals. I am conducting a research project exploring the management of patients with knee cartilage damage and as such I would welcome your assistance to obtain the following information.
1. How many patients with knee cartilage damage are referred to your Health Board for investigation / diagnosis? 

The way in which we record hospital referrals in East (Wrexham & Flintshire) and Central (Conwy & Denbighshire) areas does not include the level of information required to enable us to establish whether a patient has knee cartilage damage.  We are therefore unable to advise on the number of new patients on the waiting lists in these areas.
However, as the information is recorded different in West (Gwynedd & Anglesey) area, we can advise that as at 1st June 2021 there were 304 new patients on the waiting list.
Across the Health Board, as at 1st June 2021 there were 87 patients on our waiting list for anterior cruciate ligament (ACL) and medial patellofemoral ligament (MPFL) (ligament injuries) follow up and treatment.
2. How were these patients with knee cartilage damage diagnosed?
· Magnetic Resonance Imaging (MRI) – how many?

· Athroscopy – how many?

· Other method – how many?

In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

This is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles or stores in a central location. In order to identify the number of patients who were diagnosed with knee cartilage damage, and whether the diagnosis was via MRI or another method, would require a specific review of all individual clinical records. From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This is currently £450. In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 4,247 hours to review the 25,484 individual records of the patients referred to any one of our Trauma and Orthopaedic departments for the period 1st January 2020 to 31st December 2020. This figure is based on a timescale of 10 minutes per record, there being 25,484 records to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 4,247 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £106,175.  

As you will be aware this is not an exemption which requires us to consider the application of the public interest test.
However, we can advise that 229 patients were diagnosed with knee cartilage damage via arthroscopy.
 

3. How many were diagnosed with ICRS grade 1 cartilage damage? 

Due to the way in which we record the information, this level of detail is not recorded on our systems.  The only way in which we could identify how many patients were diagnosed with ICRS grade 1 cartilage damage, would be to review the clinical notes for each patient.  Please see our response to question 2 above.
4. How are patients ICRS grade 1 managed post diagnosis? 
	Treatment
	Number of patients

	Debridement
	NICE recommend no treatment for grade 1

	Lavage
	NICE recommend no treatment for grade 1

	Other treatment in secondary care
	None

	Referred back to primary care
	None


5. Average length of time between diagnosis and treatment of patients with ICRS grade 1 lesions? 
Due to the way in which we record our information, this level of detail is not recorded on our systems for ICRS grade 1 patients.  However, we can provide an overall waiting time for knee cartilage damage patients for East and Central areas. 
The West area has provided the following breakdown:

	Region
	Average waiting time

	East
	105 weeks for a routine patient

	Central
	111 weeks for a routine patient

	West
	48 weeks - New Outpatient
72 weeks - Day Case


6. Estimated percentage of patients treated with grade 1 lesions who would return for further treatment in the future?

Patients would only return if there was a new injury and not for further treatment.
7. Do you currently use any scaffold or materials-based techniques to treat ICRS grade 1 patients? 

No.

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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