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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 397/20/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 21st January 2021



Further to your request for information dated 20th December 2020, I am pleased to provide the following response. 

Your request and our response: 
I would like to obtain information regarding HIV+/AIDS statistics for Gwynedd, Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) as a whole, and as a ratio of rates per 100k people for both areas, for the year 2020, or at least the past 12 months.
The organisational structure of the Health Board includes the East area (Wrexham and Flintshire), Central area (Conwy and Denbighshire), and the West area (Gwynedd and Anglesey). 

Please note that due to the way the information you have requested is recorded we are only able to provide figures for the West area combined throughout this request, rather than Gwynedd alone.
1) Total number of HIV+ cases diagnosed in 2020 

Gwynedd /Anglesey: 

2
BCUHB: 



7

2) Total number of people living with HIV, including AIDS in 2020  
Please find below the number of people accessing care for HIV or AIDs in 2020:

Gwynedd / Anglesey: 
103 
BCUHB: 



354 
3) Modes of transmission of above - especially via heterosexual transmission.
	Mode of Transmission
	West area
	East area
	Central area

	Men who have sex with men
	60%
	59%
	50%

	Heterosexual
	34%
	40%
	50%

	Injection drug use (IDU)
	3%
	0%
	0%

	Mother to Child Transmission
	2%
	1%
	0%

	Blood Products
	1%
	0%
	0%


4) Total estimated number of people (presumed but not diagnosed) of people with HIV/AIDS.

Please see response to question 2. BCUHB do not routinely collect anonymous HIV sero-prevalence data in North Wales, therefore we do not hold the number of undiagnosed cases. 
5) Age breakdown 
	Age Range
	West area
	East area
	Central area

	<20 years
	1%
	Due to the way this information is recorded in the East we are only able to confirm that the age range is from 19 to 82 years.
	0%

	18 – 24 years
	1%
	
	1%

	24 – 34 years
	13%
	
	10%

	35 – 44 years
	22%
	
	19%

	45 – 54 years
	28%
	
	25%

	55 – 64 years
	23%
	
	33%

	65 – 74 years
	7%
	
	11%

	>75 years
	5%
	
	2%


6) Transmission acquired outside of Gwynedd and BCUHB. 

BCUHB do not record this information.
7) How many COVID-19 patients admitted to hospital had HIV/Aids. 
BCUHB has not had any HIV/AIDs patients admitted to hospital due to COVID-19 as at 31st December 2020.
8) Annual increase in infection over the past decade. 

West area:  The annual increase of new infections is less than 5%.  However, there is a year on year increase in the number of patients accessing care due to reasons such as new transfers, patients living longer and retained in care.
East area: A decade ago 70 patients were receiving HIV care. Currently there are 150 patients receiving care.
Central area: As of November 2020 101 patients were receiving HIV care, compared to 92 patients in 2017. Due to the way this information has historically been recorded we are unable to provide information prior to 2017.
9) Possibly a difficult one to define but urban vs rural infection for Gwynedd.  By urban I mean a town greater than 10k population.  E.g are most infections outside of Bangor or Caernarfon or within. 

BCUHB do not record this information in a way which would enable us to answer this question.










We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


