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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 364/20/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 26th January 2021


Further to your request for information dated 1st December 2020, I am pleased to provide the following response. Please accept my sincere apologies for the delay.
Your request and our response:
1. How many people have died of Covid-19 with no underlying health issues in each hospital in Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB)?
The information requested is available on the Health Board’s internet site and is therefore exempt from disclosure under Section 21 – Information accessible by other means.  Under the Health Board’s obligation to advise and assist please find below the link BCUHBs disclosure log:
https://bcuhb.nhs.wales/about-us/requests-for-information/foi-disclosure-log-2020-21/foi-disclosure-log-december-2020/
2. How many people have died with COVID-19 mentioned on the death certificate?
BCUHB does not hold this information. Under our obligation to advise and assist, please find below link to the Office for National Statistics (ONS) website. https://www.ons.gov.uk/peoplepopulationandcommunity/birthsdeathsandmarriages/deaths/bulletins/deathsregisteredweeklyinenglandandwalesprovisional/weekending27november2020 

3. On average how many people die from suicide every year in BCUHB as an example over the last five years?
BCUHB does not hold this information, Her Majesty’s Coroner is the only person who can provide a definitive conclusion of suicide following completion of an inquest. Under our obligation to advise and assist, a link to the Judiciary website is provided below should you wish to contact them for this information.

https://www.judiciary.uk/foi/ 

We have also provided a link below to the National Confidential Inquiry into Suicide and Self Harm in Mental Health (NCISH) which is managed by the University of Manchester, as Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board inputs into this.

https://sites.manchester.ac.uk/ncish/ 
The Public Health Outcomes Framework, site has suicide data included within it and can be accessed at http://www.publichealthwalesobservatory.wales.nhs.uk/phof
4. How many people have died from suicide this year in BCUHB?
As above.
5. How many cycles do you run the PCR test at? 
BCUHB does not hold this information, it is health by Public Health Wales (PHW). Under our duty to advise and assist please find the link below to PHW website.

https://phw.nhs.wales/use-of-site/contact-us/freedom-of-information/ 
6. How many people die with flu or pneumonia as the main cause of death in BCUHB on average every year, for example over the last five years?

BCUHB does not capture the cause of death data electronically therefore, we are unable to fully respond to your request to the level of detail required.  However, under our duty to advise and assist, please find below link to the Office for National Statistics (ONS) website, where further information on cause of death can be found. 

https://www.ons.gov.uk/peoplepopulationandcommunity/birthsdeathsandmarriages/deaths/bulletins/deathsregisteredweeklyinenglandandwalesprovisional/weekending27november2020 
7. How many have died with flu or pneumonia as the main cause of death in BCUHB this year? 
As above. 

8. How many BCUHB staff have been hospitalised with COVID-19?
BCUHB have had 33 staff members hospitalised with COVID-19 up until the 21st January 2021.

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


