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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 336/20/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 25th February 2021 


Further to your request for information dated 16th November 2020, I am pleased to provide the following response. Please accept our apologies for the delay. 
Your request and our response:
1. Please provide the figures for adults admitted to A&E/Hospital in Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) suffering from a stroke per year?

Provided in the table below are the number of adults admitted to our Hospitals via our Emergency Departments (EDs) suffering from a stroke. As you have not specified a date in your request, we have provided the information from 1st April 2018 to 31st December 2020. 
	Year
	Patients admitted to ED

	2018
	861

	2019
	1,266

	2020 
	1,188


2. What percentage of the population in the BCUHB area does this represent?

BCUHB does not hold this information and we are therefore unable to respond to this part of your request.
3. The number of stroke survivors (adults) upon discharge from hospital are left with an Acquired Brain Injury per year?

In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.
As this is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles, we would have to carry out a specific exercise and review the case notes for each of the patients specified in question 1 above, to identify if they acquired a brain injury as a result of a stroke.  From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450.  In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 829 hours to review the patient case notes. This figure is based on a timescale of 15 minutes per patient case note, there being 3,315 records to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 829 hours@ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £20,725.
4. What percentage does that represent of the population within the BCUHB area?

BCUHB does not hold this information and we are therefore unable to respond to this part of your request.
5. What interventions, if any, are offered with reference to the stroke survivors (adults) as to their psychological mental and physical well-being such as counselling on their discharge from hospital?

The North Wales Brain Injury Service (NWBIS) see those Stroke patients who are referred post-discharged in some of our community clinics to provide support. 
6. Are any of the interventions offered provided by an alternative Health Board due to lack of funding or availability?
None of the interventions offered are provided by an alternative Health Board.  However, the provision of (neuro) psychological care post-hospital discharge in the community, is widely recognised.

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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