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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 281/20/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 26th November 2020



Further to your request for information dated 19th October 2020, I am pleased to provide the following response. Please accept our apologies for the delay.
Your request and our response:

1.  Please provide the total amount spent by Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) for the following procedures (broken down by the applicable CCSD (Clinical Coding & Schedule Development) code) performed by independent providers between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020:
a. Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens; 
b. Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens; and 
c. YAG capsulotomy
Due to the way in which BCUHB record information we are unable to provide a breakdown of cost per procedure, however under our obligation to advise and assist we can confirm that surgical procedures were carried out on a cost per case basis at £395 per patient. The total spend in 2019/2020 was £30,810. YAG capsulotomy was not carried out. 
Optegra
2.  Please provide the total amount paid to Optegra for the following procedures (broken down by the applicable CCSD code) performed between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020:

a. Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens;

b. Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens; and

c. YAG capsulotomy

3.  Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Optegra for Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens treatment between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedures;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)
4. Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Optegra for Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens treatment between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:

a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedure;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

5.  Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Optegra for YAG capsulotomy treatment between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedure;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

6. When is you contract with Optegra for the provision of cataract procedures due for renewal?
BCUHB have not used Optegra during the period 1st April 2019 and 31st March 2020, therefore we do not hold this information. 
Spamedica
7.  Please provide the total amount paid to Spamedica for the following procedures (broken down by the applicable CCSD code) performed between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020:

a. Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens;

b. Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens; and

c. YAG capsulotomy

8.  Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Spamedica for Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedures;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

9. Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Spamedica for Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedure;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided

10. Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Spamedica for YAG capsulotomy treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedure;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

11. When is you contract with Spamedica for the provision of cataract procedures due for renewal?
BCUHB have not used Spamedica during the period 1st April 2019 and 31st March 2020, therefore we do not hold this information. 
Newmedica
12. Please provide the total amount paid to Newmedica for the following procedures (broken down by the applicable CCSD code) performed between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020:

a. Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens;

b. Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens; and

c. YAG capsulotomy

13. Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Newmedica for Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedures;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

14. Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Newmedica for Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedure;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

15. Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Newmedica for YAG capsulotomy treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedure;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

16. When is you contract with Newmedica for the provision of cataract procedures due for renewal?
BCUHB have not used Newmedica during the period 1st April 2019 and 31st March 2020, therefore we do not hold this information. 
Anglia Community Eye Service
17. Please provide the total amount paid to Anglia Community Eye Service (ACES) for the following procedures (broken down by the applicable CCSD code) performed between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020:

a. Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens;

b. Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens; and

c. YAG capsulotomy

18. Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Anglia Community Eye Service (ACES) for Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedures;

b. Amount paid in pre and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

19. Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Anglia Community Eye Service (ACES) for Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedure;

b. Amount paid in pre and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

20. Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Anglia Community Eye Service (ACES) for YAG capsulotomy treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedure;

b. Amount paid in pre and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

21. When is you contract with Anglia Community Eye Service (ACES) for the provision of cataract procedures due for renewal?
BCUHB have not used Anglia Community Eye Service (ACES) during the period 1st April 2019 and 31st March 2020, therefore we do not hold this information. 
Optical Express
22. Please provide the total amount paid to Optical Express for the following procedures (broken down by the applicable CCSD code) performed between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020:

a. Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens;

b. Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens; and

c. YAG capsulotomy

23. Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Optical Express for Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedures;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

24. Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Optical Express for Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedure;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

25. Please provide a breakdown of the amount paid to Optical Express for YAG capsulotomy treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedure;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)

26. When is you contract with Optical Express for the provision of cataract procedures due for renewal?
BCUHB have not used Optical Express during the period 1st April 2019 and 31st March 2020, therefore we do not hold this information. 
Other providers
27. For the period 1st of April 2019 to 31st of March 2020, please provide the names of any additional independent sector providers that have provided cataract and/or YAG capsulotomy procedures to the Group. 
BCUHB can confirm that between 1st of April 2019 and 31st of March 2020, SHS Partners Surgical Ltd provided procedures to the Group. 
28. For each additional independent provider please provide the total amount paid for the following procedures (broken down by the applicable CCSD code) performed between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020:
a. Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens; 
b. Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens; and YAG capsulotomy
Please see response to Question 1.
29. For each additional independent provider please provide a breakdown of the amount paid for Cataract with implantation of a spherical (non toric) Intraocular Lens treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedures; 
b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided) 
The information you are requesting is exempt from disclosure under section 43(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA).

It is considered that the release of the requested information is likely to prejudice the commercial interests of Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB).  The release of such information is likely to deter a number of organisations from entering into contracts with the NHS. This will negatively affect the NHS in engaging in commercial activity and carrying out its function of delivering effective health care provision to the public.

The Public Interest Test 
In considering the application of the section 43 exemption it is necessary to consider the balance of the public interest for and against disclosure.

Public Interest for disclosure
As the NHS is funded through public money it is especially important that its commissioning and spending activities are scrutinised and held to high account. Disclosure of the information would enable the public to see how much of taxpayers’ money is being spent. 

Public Interest against disclosure
It is not in the public interest for a national organisation such as the NHS to be prejudiced when engaging in commercial activity. Disclosure would lead to a risk of the NHS being unable to effectively commission services for patients.


The balance of the public interest
Whilst disclosure may give the public an insight in to how money is being spent on new premises for GP surgeries, there are other avenues in which NHS spending is being scrutinised and made transparent, i.e. published budgets for general spending within the NHS. 

Therefore, in considering the balance it is considered that the public interest lies against disclosure.
30. For each additional independent provider please provide a breakdown of the amount paid for Cataract with implantation of a toric intraocular lens treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedure;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)
Please see response to Question 1.

31. For each additional independent provider please provide a breakdown of the amount paid for YAG capsulotomy treatments between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020, indicating:
a. Amount paid in fees for the surgical procedure;

b. Amount paid in pre- and post-operative consultation fees (including stating the services provided)
There were no YAG capsulotomy treatments carried out between 1st April 2019 and 31st March 2020 in BCUHB. 
32. For each additional independent provider please state when your contract for cataract procedures is due for renewal.
The contract for cataract procedures in BCUHB
 has expired and the service is working through operational plans to establish if there is a future service requirement for insourcing. 

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


