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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 261/20/FOI 


	Dyddiad / Date: 11th November 2020



Further to your request for information dated 8th October 2020, I am pleased to provide the following response. 

Your question and our response:
1. How many General Practices/ GP Surgeries have made use of the services of the external private company 'GP Hub Wales' (http://gphub.org/ ) within the last five years? Can you note the figures by year and also by local council please?
	Local Council 
	2019/2020

	Wrexham
	6

	Flintshire 
	1

	Denbighshire
	0

	Conwy 
	1

	Gwynedd
	1

	Ynys Mon
	2


Please note this information was not recorded prior to 2019.
2. How many General Practices/ GP Surgeries are there in the Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB)?
As of 1st October 2020, there are 98 practices within BCUHB. 
3. How many General Practices/ GP Surgeries are under direct rule of the BCUHB That is, how many do the health board run directly?
As of 1st October 2020, there are 13 directly managed practices within BCUHB. 
4. How many General Practices/ GP Surgeries have been under the direct rule of the BCUHB in the last five years? Please state the figures by year and also by Local council areas. 

	Local Council 
	2015-2016 
	2016-2017
	2017-2018
	2018-2019
	2019- 2020

	Ynys Mon 
	0
	0
	0
	1
	2

	Gwynedd 
	1
	1
	2
	3
	3

	Conwy 
	0
	2
	2
	3
	3

	Denbighshire
	3
	1
	1
	1
	1

	Flintshire
	0
	0
	1
	2
	2

	Wrexham
	1
	3
	6
	6
	4


5. How much money has BCUHB paid to the private consultancy agency 'GP Hub Wales' in the last five years? Please note the figures by year and also by the local council area.

Please see the table below regarding expenditure to GP Hub Wales between 2019 and 2020. Expenditure was not recorded prior to this financial year. 
	Payments to GP Hub

	
	2019/2020

	Wrexham
	£26,730 

	Flintshire
	£450 

	Denbighshire
	£0

	Conwy
	£3,780

	Gwynedd
	£225 

	Ynys Mon 
	£30,375


6. Has BCUHB paid any other similar companies that provide medical consultancy work such as GP HUB Wales in the last five years? If yes, please confirm how much and give a breakdown of the numbers for every year over the past five. 

BCUHB have not paid any other companies to provide medical consultancy work within the last five years. 

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


