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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 149/20/FOI


	Dyddiad / Date: 11th September 2020



Further to your request for information dated 31st July 2020, I am pleased to provide the following response. Please accept our sincere apologies for the delay.
Your request and our response:
I’m looking into the problems faced by young people in the community and how we can tackle them. I'm defining the 'Llanaelhaearn area' as the Parishes of Llanaelhaearn and Pistyll and seeking information on the following questions and requests:

1. What are the rates of mental illness in the area of Llanaelhaearn, broken down by age?
2. Breakdown of the types of mental illnesses found in the area of Llanaelhaearn.
3. Any information to do with causes of mental illnesses in the area of Llanaelhaearn.
 

We are unable to respond to this request as Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) does not hold this data. We do not record location in a way which would enable us to provide information specifically about the area of Llanaelhaearn, as we would need to know exactly which postcode areas you are interested in. Additionally, even if we knew which postcode areas to include, the information would only be for inpatients and outpatients, and would not include GP or community activity.

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


