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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 130/20/FOI


	Dyddiad / Date: 7th September 2020



Further to your request for information dated 23rd July 2020, I am pleased to provide the following response.  Please accept our sincere apologies for the delay.
Your request and our response:
1. Which departments prescribe DigiFab to patients?
DigiFab have been issued by our Pharmacy department to Intensive Treatment Unit, Coronary Care and the Emergency Department across the three acute hospitals within Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB).
2. For which indications was DigiFab prescribed?
3. What was the percentage of acute vs chronic digoxin toxicities for which DigiFab was prescribed?
4. Did prescribers contact national poison centre regarding use of DigiFab?
5. What percentage of a patient with digoxin toxicity were treated with DigiFab?
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Health Board pharmacy system does not hold the data in a format that would enable us to fully respond to your request to the level of detail required.  The only way we could identify what indications DigiFab was prescribed for, the number of patients with chronic toxicity, the prescribers actions and then the percentage of acute vs chronic digoxin toxicities for which DigiFab was prescribed would be to carry out a review of the patient case notes to obtain this information.
As this is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to collate this data.  From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450.  In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 187,430 hours to locate and review the case notes of the 562,291 patients admitted to one of our hospitals between 1st January 2015 to 31st May 2020 to obtain the information required. This figure is based on a timescale of 20 minutes per case note to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 187,430 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £4,685,750.

6. What protocol was followed for treatment of digoxin toxicity? 
BCUHB uses the poisons information database Toxbase.
7. How many patients per year, for the past 5 years, have been prescribed DigiFab?
8. Of the patients who were admitted with Digoxin toxicity, how many recovered to have safe levels of serum digoxin?
9. Of the patients treated with DigiFab, how many recovered to have safe levels of serum digoxin? 
We are unable to respond to these questions as we do not hold the data in a retrievable format.  Please see our response to questions 2 to 5 above.
10. What percentage of patients are admitted and treated for: 

a. acute digoxin toxicity and 

b. chronic digoxin toxicity?

From our Data Warehouse system which contains anonymous data, BCUHB can advise that 0.0048% (27 of 562,291) of patients admitted was for acute toxicity, however we are unable to provide a percentage for chronic digoxin toxicity as we do not code for this. 
11. What percentage of patients admitted with acute digoxin toxicity, purposely ingested digoxin i.e. intentionally self-harmed? 
From our Data Warehouse system which contains anonymous data, BCUHB can advise that 14.8% (4 of 27) of patients admitted with acute digoxin toxicity intentionally ingested digoxin.
12. How many vials of DigiFab have been prescribed in your Health Board in the past 5 years?
Over the past 5 years 31 vials of DigiFab have been issued by our Pharmacy department to Intensive Treatment Unit, Coronary Care and the Emergency Department, however, 12 of these were returned expired.  It is not known how many were prescribed, as this information is not recorded on the Pharmacy system.
13. How many vials do you keep in stock in each of the hospitals?
	Hospital
	Stock held (at any one time)

	Ysbyty Gwynedd
	7 vials

	Ysbyty Glan Clwyd
	10 vials

	Wrexham Maelor Hospital
	10 vials


27 is the standard stock volume held within the Emergency Departments across BCUHB, dependent on their expiry date.

14. How many patients per year, for the past 5 years, have been admitted with digoxin toxicity?
	
	Digoxin toxicity admissions

	2015
	8

	2016
	3

	2017
	5

	2018
	5

	2019
	6


* Please note that information provided in the table above is for patients who had the appropriate coding described in their admitting episode.  Patients who did not have the diagnosis in the admitting episode but were diagnosed later in their stay are captured in the data provided above.  This would require individual case note review, please see response to questions 2 to 5 above.  

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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