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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 121/20/FOI


	Dyddiad / Date: 11th September 2020



Further to your request for information dated 21st July 2020, I am pleased to provide the following in response to your request. Please accept our sincere apologies for the delay.
Your request and our response:
1. Please detail the number of patients currently prescribed apremilast with a current primary diagnosis of: a) Psoriasis b) Psoriatic Arthritis?

Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) does not hold this information in a format that would enable us to provide a response to your request. However, under our duty to advise and assist, a search on our pharmacy systems has identified that 8 patients are currently receiving apremilast. Unfortunately the pharmacy systems do not provide the level of detail to differentiate the patient’s current primary diagnosis, therefore the Health Board is unable to answer this part of the request.  
2. Of the patients prescribed apremilast in the last 12 months for Psoriasis and Psoriatic Arthritis, what number of patients received treatment with targeted small molecules or biologic therapies* prior to beginning treatment with apremilast? (*See annex 1 for a list of small molecule/biologic therapies) 

Please see our response to question one above. However, again under our duty to advise and assist, a search on our pharmacy systems has identified that 11 patients have received apremilast in the last 12 months. We are unable to identify if these 11 patients had prior treatment as mentioned in question one the pharmacy systems do not provide the level of detail to differentiate the patient’s diagnosis.
3. How many small molecule and/or biologic naive patients in the Health Board are currently receiving a conventional non-biologic systemic therapy for Psoriasis or a conventional non-biologic disease-modifying anti-rheumatic drug (DMARD) for Psoriatic Arthritis? (e.g. methotrexate)

In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Health Board does not hold the data in a format that would enable us to fully respond to your request to the level of detail required.  The only way we could identify how many patients are currently receiving a conventional non-biologic system therapy for Psoriasis or a conventional DMARD for Psoriatic Arthritis would be to review the case note of every patient with a diagnosis of Psoriasis or Psoriatic Arthritis. We are able to confirm from our pharmacy systems, that 3,143 prescriptions have been issued for DMARDs, but in order to answer your question these would need to be reviewed.
As this is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to collate this data.  From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450.  In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 262 hours to locate and review these prescriptions. This figure is based on a timescale of 5  minutes per prescription, there being thousands to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 262 @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £6550.
4. Is CCG prior approval required for the prescribing of apremilast? Y/N. If Yes, please tick the system you use: Blueteq □/Other □.

No, CCG prior-approval is not required for the prescribing of apremilast.
5. If other, what system do you use? 

Not applicable, please see the response to question 4 above.
6. Is apremilast listed individually or grouped with biologic therapies on the priorapproval form for Psoriasis and Psoriatic Arthritis? 

Psoriasis: Individually □ grouped □ Psoriatic Arthritis: Individually □ grouped □.
Not applicable, please see the response to question 4 above.
7. Please provide the wording used on the CCG’s prior approval form for the prescribing of apremilast.
Not applicable, please see the response to question 4 above. 

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh
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