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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 086/20/FOI


	Dyddiad / Date: 30th July 2020



Further to your request for information dated 17th June 2020, I am pleased to provide the following response. Please accept our sincere apologies for the delay.
Your request and our response:

1. How many Covid-19 outbreaks have there been in care homes in your region between March 1st and June 16th 2020?

We are unable to respond to this request as Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) does not record or hold this data.  

However, under our obligation to advise and assist, we can confirm that the Office of National Statistics (ONS) is collating data across England and Wales.  Please find below the link to reports on deaths involving Covid-19 by Local Authority area: 

https://www.ons.gov.uk/
Public Health Wales (PHW) is also collating Covid 19 data for the whole of Wales, Please find links below to the PHW website and their FOI email address should you wish to contact them: 

https://phw.nhs.wales/topics/latest-information-on-novel-coronavirus-covid-19/
2. How many care homes did you provide oxygen to as a result of Covid-19 outbreaks between:
a) March 1st to April 15th?
b) April 15th to June 16th?
BCUHB has not supplied oxygen to any care homes. Care home residents access oxygen as part of GP prescriptions to manage their planned clinical care needs, or as an urgent unplanned medicine if oxygen was administered by the ambulance service.
3. How many hospital patients were discharged to care homes between:
a) March 1st to April 15th?
b) April 15th to June 16th?
	
	Discharged to care home

	1st March – 15th April 2020
	332

	16th April – 16th June 2020
	575


4. How many hospital patients discharged to care homes were tested for Covid-19?  Please give totals for:
a) March 1st to April 15th?
b) April 15th to June 16th?
	
	Tested

	1st March – 15th April 2020
	7

	16th April – 16th June 2020
	72


Please note that BCUHB have followed Welsh Government guidance throughout the course of the pandemic. Guidance issued by Welsh Government on 8th April 2020 required Health Boards to notify care homes of the results of any patients who had previously had a test for COVID-19, either at the time of transfer from hospital to a care home, or in a ‘timely manner’ thereafter. This guidance did not set out that negative tests were required prior to transfer or admission into a residential care bed. 

On 22nd April 2020, a letter was received from Welsh Government requesting that all patients being discharged from hospital to a step down or care home setting be tested regardless of whether or not they were admitted to hospital with COVID-19.  The Health Board has complied with these requirements.  

5. How many of the test results in question 4 were:

a) Positive?
b) Negative? 

c) Inconclusive/void?

Provided in the table below are the test results of the patients identified in question 4, however please note that none of the patients identified had an inconclusive/void test result.
	
	Positive
	Negative

	1st March – 15th April 2020
	0
	7

	16th April – 16th June 2020
	2
	70


6. How many of the hospital patients discharged to care homes who tested positive for Covid-19 were asymptomatic?
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.
Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) does not record this information in a way which enables us to accurately respond to your request.  There is no clinical code for asymptomatic patients, therefore to enable us to provide an accurate response we would have to review 907 patient records, as identified in question 3 above.

As this is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to collate this data.  From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450.  In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 151 hours to locate and review patient record. This figure is based on a timescale of 10 minutes per patient record, there being 907 records to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 151 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £3,775.

7. How many Covid-19 related ambulance call-out requests did you receive from care homes between:
a) March 1st to April 15th?
b) April 15th to June 16th?
We do not hold Welsh Ambulance data, however under our obligation to advise and assist we have included the link below to Welsh Ambulance Services NHS Trust.

https://www.ambulance.wales.nhs.uk/
8. How many of the call-out requests referred to in question 6 did you send an ambulance to between:
a) March 1st to April 15th?
b) April 15th to June 16th?
Please refer to our response to question 7 above.

9. How many care home residents did you admit to hospital between March 1st to June 16th.  Please give totals for:
a) Those with suspected or confirmed Covid-19?
b) Non-Covid-19 related patients?
The information provided below is for a patient’s first admission, we have not included any subsequent admissions for the same patient. Please note that the figures provided are taken from clinical coding information which is only complete to Welsh Government Standard to the end of April 2020.
	Admissions
	March
	April
	May
	Up to 16th June

	Non-Covid related 
	79
	78
	75
	67

	Suspected or Confirmed Covid related 
	1
	29
	23
	3



We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


