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	Ein cyf / Our ref: 073/20/FOI


	Dyddiad / Date: 3rd July 2020



Further to your request for information dated 9th June 2020, I am pleased to provide the following in response to your request.
Your request and our response:
1. In Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) how many patients have been treated with the following Somatostatin Analogues in the latest 12 month period?

· Octreotide

· Lanreotide

· Pasireotide 
Please note that the hospital supply is an estimate due to some clinical areas and wards holding octreotide as stock, and pharmacy does not hold a record of who has been treated with stock. However, we are able to provide the following:
	Medication
	Hospital supplied
Number of patients
(01/06/19-31/05/20)
	Community supplied

Number of prescriptions
(01/04/19-31/03/20)*

	Octreotide
	63
	94

	Lanreotide
	8
	83

	Pasireotide
	0
	0



* We are unable to provide the same time period due to a lag time within the 

Primary Care data.
2. In the latest 12 month period how many Acromegaly patients have been treated with the following drugs?

· Sandostatin LAR

· Octreotide Long-Acting (Generic)

· Somatuline Autogel

· Pasireotide

· Pegvisomant

Please note that due to the way BCUHB records information on our pharmacy system we are unable to specify whether these patients are being treated for acromegaly as we do not record this information on the pharmacy system.  However, we are able to provide details of the supply of drugs as follows:
	Medication
	Hospital supplied
Number of patients

(01/06/19-31/05/20)
	Community supplied

Number of prescriptions

(01/04/19-31/03/20)*

	Sandostatin LAR
	8
	33

	Octreotide Long-Acting (Generic)
	0
	9

	Somatuline Autogel
	5
	76

	Pasireotide
	0
	0

	Pegvisomant
	0
	0



* We are unable to provide the same time period due to a lag time within the 

Primary Care data.

3. How many patients have received a somatropin treatment for growth hormone deficiency in the latest 12-month period?

· Genotropin

· Humatrope

· Norditropin

· Nutropin

· Omnitrope

· Saizen

· Zomacton
Please note that due to the way BCUHB records information we are unable to specify whether these patients are being treated for growth hormone deficiency as we do not record this information on the pharmacy system.  However, we are able to provide details of the supply of drugs as follows .  Please also note that there were an additional 43 community supplied issues where the brand was unknown.

	Medication
	Hospital supplied
Number of patients

(01/06/19-31/05/20)
	Community supplied

Number of prescriptions

(01/04/19-31/03/20)*

	Genotropin
	33
	155

	Humatrope
	9
	74

	Norditropin
	18
	204

	Nutropin
	0
	0 issues

	Omnitrope
	4
	0 issues

	Saizen
	0
	0 issues

	Zomacton
	0
	44 issues



* We are unable to provide the same time period due to a lag time within the 

Primary Care data.
4. Provide the number of patients under the age 16 that were treated with each of the following drugs in the latest 12-month period?

· Genotropin

· Humatrope     

· Norditropin

· Nutropin

· Omnitrope

· Saizen

· Zomacton
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.

The Pharmacy system used does not record a patient’s age, therefore we are unable to fully respond to your request to the level of detail required.  The only way we could identify if a patient was under 16 would be to check each individual drug request and prescription.  This would establish if there were any duplicate requests or prescriptions for the same patient, we would then need to review our hospital clinical systems to obtain the patient’s age for their health record.
As this is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to collate this data.  From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450.  In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 48 hours to locate and review the 584 hospital drug requests and prescriptions (including the 43 unknown) as referred to in question 3 above. This figure is based on a timescale of 5 minutes per record, there being 584 of records to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 48 @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £1,200.

We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


