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Further to your request for information dated 20th May 2020, I am pleased to provide the following in response to your request.  Please accept our sincere apologies for the delay.
Your request and our response:

1. How many patients have been transferred from your hospitals into care homes to free up capacity and for other reasons since 1st March 2020?
Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) can confirm that there were 488 individual patients discharged to care/residential/nursing homes between 1st March 2020 and 31st May 2020.  BCUHB did not transfer patients into care homes to specifically free up hospital capacity, but did discharge based on individual assessments, care needs and the right place of care for their care journey.
2. Of these how many were new admissions to that care home and how many were being moved back into an existing placement?
In accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000, this letter acts as a Refusal Notice under section 17 of the Act.
Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board (BCUHB) does not record this information in a way which enables us to accurately respond to your request.  To enable us to accurately respond to this request we would have to to carry out a review of the 488 patient records identified in question 1 above, to determine if their destination was a new admission or an existing placement.

As this is not information that the Health Board routinely compiles, we would have to carry out a specific exercise to collate this data.  From our preliminary assessment, we estimate that to comply with your particular request would exceed the appropriate costs limit under section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.  This is currently £450.  In reaching this decision we estimate that it would take staff in excess of 81 hours to locate and review the patient records. This figure is based on a timescale of 10 minutes per patient record, there being 488 patient records to review. Therefore, to obtain the data would work out at approximately 81 hours @ £25.00 per hour (cost permitted under the Act) = £2,025.

3. How many of these patients were tested for the Covid-19 virus prior to transferring / post transfer?
Of the patients identified in question 1 above, 33 were tested for Covid-19 prior to transfer and 3 patients were tested for Covid-19 between their discharge date and 14 days after discharge date.
Please note that BCUHB have followed Welsh Government guidance throughout the course of the pandemic. Guidance issued by Welsh Government on 8th April 2020 required Health Boards to notify care homes of the results of any patients who had previously had a test for COVID-19, either at the time of transfer from hospital to a care home, or in a ‘timely manner’ thereafter. This guidance did not set out that negative tests were required prior to transfer or admission into a residential care bed. 

On 22nd April 2020, a letter was received from Welsh Government requesting that all patients being discharged from hospital to a step down or care home setting be tested regardless of whether or not they were admitted to hospital with COVID-19.  The Health Board has complied with these requirements.  

4. How many of these patients have since been identified as having contracted the Covid-19 virus?
All 3 of the patients identified in question 3 who were tested after they were discharged tested positive for Covid-19. 
5. How many of these patients are known to have died from or with Covid-19 subsequently?
The cause of death data is not held by BCUHB for deaths within the community.  However, for this cohort, none are known to have died in hospital with a diagnosis of either a confirmed or unconfirmed Covid-19 case.
Under our obligation to advise and assist, information on the cause of death by location is available from the Office of National Statistics (ONS).  Please find below a website link to the ONS.
https://www.ons.gov.uk/peoplepopulationandcommunity/birthsdeathsandmarriages/deaths/datasets/deathsinvolvingcovid19inthecaresectorenglandandwales










We welcome correspondence through the medium of Welsh

Rydym yn croesawu gohebiaeth drwy gyfrwng y Gymraeg


